Big Bear Fire Authority

4
EST 2012 8

BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
December 9, 2025, Regular Board Meeting
5:00 p.m.
BOARD OF DIRECTORS STAFF
Board Chair Kendi Segovia Fire Chief Luke Wagner
Vice Chair Bob Rowe Director of Business Services Kristin Mandolini
Director Rick Herrick Interim Board Secretary Sherry Wentz
Director Charles Hicks Authority Counsel Joseph Sanchez
Director Perri Melnick Assistant Authority Counsel Nicholaus Norvell
Director Randall Putz
Director JoKay Rowe
Director John Russo
Director Larry Walsh
Director Al Ziegler

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that a Regular Meeting of the Big Bear Fire Authority will be held
on Tuesday, December 9, 2025, at 5:00 p.m. This meeting will be held at the Big Bear Fire
Department, Station 281, located at 41090 Big Bear Boulevard, Big Bear Lake, CA; said meeting
being called pursuant to Section 54953 of the Government Code of the State of California to
consider the following matters:

OPEN SESSION

CALL TO ORDER

MOMENT OF SILENCE / PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

ROLL CALL

Please Note: The Chair may, at his or her discretion, take items out of order at the meeting
to facilitate the business of the Board and/or for the convenience of the public.

ANNOUNCEMENTS & UPCOMING EVENTS

The Fire Authority’s Administrative Office will be closed:
e Wednesday and Thursday, December 24 and 25, 2025, in observance of Christmas and
will reopen on Monday, December 29, 2025, at 8:00 a.m.
e Wednesday and Thursday, December 31, 2025, and January 1, 2026, in observance of
New Year’s Day and will reopen on Monday, January 5, 2026, at 8:00 a.m.

PRESENTATIONS

None



FIRE AUTHORITY PAGE 2 December 9, 2025

DIRECTORS’ GENERAL ANNOUNCEMENTS — Comments shall pertain to items not on the
posted agenda and are limited to three minutes per Authority Member.

GENERAL PUBLIC COMMENT - Members of the public who wish to comment on topics not
included on the agenda or comment on agendized topics are invited to provide comments. Please
note that State law prohibits the Authority from taking action on items not listed on the agenda.
There is a three-minute maximum time limit when addressing the Board; this time limit may be
shortened by the Chair to accommodate a large number of speakers.

CHIEF’S REPORT

Speaker: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief

FINANCE OFFICER’S REPORT

None

FIRE AUTHORITY CONSENT CALENDAR

FA1l. | Approval of Demands — Check Issue Date 9/1/2025 through 10/31/202S5 in the
amount of $1,732,621.04.

FA2. | Approval of Meeting Minutes from the November 5, 2025, Special Meeting of
the Big Bear Fire Authority.

FA3. | Receive and File Big Bear Fire Authority Monthly Report for September and
October 2025.

ITEMS REMOVED FROM THE CONSENT CALENDAR

PUBLIC HEARING

Any person can be heard in support or opposition to the proposals at the time of the meeting. If
you challenge the action in court, you may be limited to raising only those issues which you or
someone else raised at the public meeting described in the notice or in written correspondence
delivered to the Fire Authority at or before the public meeting.

FA4. | Public Hearing of Proposed Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001 ADOPTION OF
THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND THE 2025
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, ALONG WITH
CERTAIN CHANGES, MODIFICATIONS, AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS,
DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS, ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001

Board consideration of conducting a Public Hearing and waiving of the second
reading to adopt Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001.



FIRE AUTHORITY PAGE 3 December 9, 2025

ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE BIG
BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY, A CALIFORNIA JOINT POWERS
AUTHORITY, ADOPTING THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE, THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA WILDLAND-
URBAN INTERFACE CODE, AND THE 2025 EDITION OF THE
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, ALONG WITH CERTAIN
CHANGES, MODIFICATIONS, AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS,
DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS THERETO

Speaker: Fire Chief Luke Wagner and Legal Counsel Nicholaus Norvell

NEW BUSINESS

BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY DISCUSSION ITEMS

FAS.| Use of Facilities Agreement for the Paradise Training Center

Board consideration to discuss and approve the Board Chair to sign the 12- month
Use of Facility Agreement between Big Bear City Community Services District
and Big Bear Fire Authority.

FA6. | Amendment to Fiscal Year 2025-2026 Big Bear Fire Authority Budget
(Initiated by Director Russo)

Staff recommends the Board discuss and provide direction to staff.

FA7.| Board Reorganization - Chair and Vice Chair

Board nominations and selection of Chair and Vice Chair, who will serve for a
period of one year.

Speaker: Kendi Segovia, Board Chair

COMMITTEE REPORTS

None

DIRECTORS’ CLOSING COMMENTS




FIRE AUTHORITY PAGE 4 December 9, 2025

CLOSED SESSION PUBLIC COMMUNICATIONS: (Any member of the public is entitled to
speak on Closed Session Agenda item. If you wish to address any other items listed on the Agenda,
you must do so during Open Session.)

CLOSED SESSION

1. PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT
Title: Board Secretary

2. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS (GOVERNMENT CODE §
54957.6)
Agency Designated Representative(s): Luke Wagner, Fire Chief
Unrepresented Employee: Board Secretary

3. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS (GOVERNMENT CODE §
54957.6)
Agency Designated Representative(s): Luke Wagner, Fire Chief
Employee Organization: Big Bear Professional Firefighters’ Assoc., IAFF, Local 935

4. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL—ANTICIPATED LITIGATION

Significant exposure to litigation pursuant to Government Code Section
54956.9(d)(2): One (1) potential case

REPORT FROM CLOSED SESSION

ADJOURN

I 'hereby certify under penalty of perjury, under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing
agenda was posted in accordance with the applicable legal requirements. Dated this 4th day of
December 2025.

\s\ Sherry Wentz
Sherry Wentz
Interim Board Secretary

The Big Bear Fire Authority wishes to make all its public meetings accessible to the public. If you need special
assistance to participate in this meeting, please contact Interim Board Secretary Sherry Wentz at 909/866-7566.
Notification 48 hours prior to the meeting will enable the Fire Authority to make reasonable arrangements to ensure
accessibility to this meeting.



BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
AGENDA REPORT

MEETING DATE:  December 9, 2025

TO: Board Chair and Directors of Big Bear Fire Authority
FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief W
SUBJECT: CHIEF’S REPORT

Board Requested Information

Wood Shake/Shingle Roofs Homes

At its November 5, 2025, meeting, the Board asked if it was known how many homes
within the Authority’s justification still have wood shake/shingle roofs.

Currently, we have 10 wood shake/shingled homes in our area (8 located in Big Bear City
and 2 in the City of Big Bear Lake), this number is limited to residential structures and not
out laying buildings, such as sheds, barns, etc. You may be thinking how is the number of
remaining wood shake/shingled homes so low?

Contributing factors may be any of the following: property owners have participated in
grant programs available to assist local homeowners financially in their roof replacement
efforts; insurance companies have stepped in forcing the replacements of roofs as a
condition of insurability, as these types of roofs have been identified as a high hazard; and
Assembly Bill 38 (effective July 1, 2021), which mandates sellers of residential properties
located in High- or Very-High Hazard Severity Zones must provide documentation of a
compliant Defensible Space Inspection (known as our AB38 inspection process) before
closing a real estate transaction, and once a roof has been identified as a hazard, it forces
remediation as a condition of the sale of the home. At the close of the grant reimbursement
programs, a notice of pendency was placed on the remaining properties with wood shake
shingle roofs, which was processed by the County of San Bernardino and the City of Big
Bear Lake.



Accounts Payable

Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number

Item No. FA1

User: kmandolini
Printed: 12/2/2025 2:02 PM

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount

Invoice No Description Reference

ACH HicksC Charles Hicks 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor HicksC: 130.00

ACH Melnick Perri Melnick 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor Melnick: 130.00

ACH PutzR Randall Putz 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor PutzR: 130.00

ACH SegoK Kendi Segovia 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor SegoK: 130.00

ACH HicksC Charles Hicks 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor HicksC: 130.00

ACH Melnick Perri Melnick 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor Melnick: 130.00

ACH PutzR Randall Putz 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor PutzR: 130.00

ACH SegoK Kendi Segovia 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 390.00
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor SegoK: 390.00

ACH 02EDD California State Employment Development 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 State Income Tax PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Stat: 18,270.90
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor 02EDD: 18,270.90

ACH IRS Department Of Treasury 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Federal Income Tax PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Fede 45,255.08
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Medicare PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Med 5,585.50
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Medicare Employer PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Med 4,935.70
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor IRS: 55,776.28

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 1


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HicksC
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Melnick
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=PutzR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SegoK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HicksC
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Melnick
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=PutzR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SegoK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=02EDD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IRS

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

ACH 02EDD California State Employment Development 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 State Income Tax PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Stat« 19,082.04
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor 02EDD: 19,082.04

ACH IRS Department Of Treasury 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Medicare Employer PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Med 5,175.94
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Medicare PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Med 5,524.39
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Federal Income Tax PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Fede¢ 48,250.90
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor IRS: 58,951.23

ACH 02EDD California State Employment Development 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 State Income Tax PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Stat« 19,034.54
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 State Unemployment I PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Stat« 4.30
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor 02EDD: 19,038.84

ACH IRS Department Of Treasury 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Medicare Employer PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Med 5,690.66
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Federal Income Tax PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Fede¢ 47,540.14
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Medicare PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Med 6,483.21
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor IRS: 59,714.01

ACH WinsL Scanner 1 09/25/2025
RentOct-Dec25 284 rent Oct - Dec 9,947.74
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor WinsL: 9,947.74

ACH 02EDD California State Employment Development 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 State Income Tax PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Stat 18,978.94
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor 02EDD: 18,978.94

ACH IRS Department Of Treasury 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Medicare Employer PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Med 4,951.43
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Medicare PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Med 5,740.98
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Federal Income Tax PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Fede 47,436.01
Total for this ACH Check for Vendor IRS: 58,128.42

18768  BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/11/2025
BVES281Aug25 285 electric service 3,506.67
Total for Check Number 18768: 3,506.67

18769 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/11/2025
BVES285Aug25 285 electric service 1,239.67
Total for Check Number 18769: 1,239.67

18771 Bound Bound Tree Medical, LLC 09/11/2025
BoundTreeAug25 bandages, suction kits, Zoll, gloves, electrodes 8,600.65
Total for Check Number 18771: 8,600.65

18772  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Chart282TVAug25 282 TV service 633.40
Total for Check Number 18772: 633.40

18773  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 2


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=02EDD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IRS
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=02EDD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IRS
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=WinsL
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=02EDD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IRS
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Bound
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Chart284Aug25 284 phone/internet service 159.97
Total for Check Number 18773: 159.97

18774  caltool CTWS LLC 09/11/2025
DK8196 281 oxygen 317.25
DK8197 282 oxygen 247.50
Total for Check Number 18774: 564.75

18775  HutchinD Dawn Hutchinson 09/11/2025
GiffordReim25 strike team reimbursement 786.00
Total for Check Number 18775: 786.00

18776  Rolapp Fieldman Rolapp & Associates 09/11/2025
31026 professional services 496.50
Total for Check Number 18776: 496.50

18777  Fisher] John Fisher 09/11/2025
Gold/Little2025 strike team reimbursement 602.80
Total for Check Number 18777: 602.80

18778  Frontier Frontier Communications 09/11/2025
Front282aAug252 282 Aux phone service 77.99
Total for Check Number 18778: 77.99

18779  Frontier Frontier Communications 09/11/2025
Front282Aug252 282 phone service 78.57
Total for Check Number 18779: 78.57

18780  Frontier Frontier Communications 09/11/2025
Front283Aug252 283 phone service 269.10
Total for Check Number 18780: 269.10

18781  GinosT Gino's Tire and Auto 09/11/2025
241690 BC2805 new tires and alignment 1,694.56
Total for Check Number 18781: 1,694.56

18782  Image200 Image 2000 09/11/2025
736626 copier toner 16.75
791142 copier toner 16.75
Total for Check Number 18782: 33.50

18783  CitlennL Lida Jennings 09/11/2025
BFA25A885 citation reimbursement 816.00
Total for Check Number 18783: 816.00

18784  KlarK Kevin Klar 09/11/2025
LittleReimb25 strike team reimbursement 264.60
Total for Check Number 18784: 264.60

18785 BWSLAW Burke Williams and Sorensen LLP 09/11/2025
349253 professional services 115.50

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 3


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=caltool
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HutchinD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Rolapp
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=FisherJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=GinosT
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Image200
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CitJennL
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KlarK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BWSLAW

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18785: 115.50

18786  CitMartA Adolfo Martinez 09/11/2025
BFA25A383 citation reimbursement 184.00
Total for Check Number 18786: 184.00

18787 McHarg Timothy McHargue 09/11/2025
ShastaReimb25 strike team meal reimbursement 28.00
Total for Check Number 18787: 28.00

18788  MountWat Mountain Water Company LLC 09/11/2025
95628-10161 bottled wateer service 24.00
Total for Check Number 18788: 24.00

18789  CurrPete Pete Curran 09/11/2025
LittleReimb2025 strike team reimbursement 328.30
Total for Check Number 18789: 328.30

18790  SBClInnov Innovation & Technology Dept. San Bernar 09/11/2025
31218 radio maintenance fee 2,732.99
31218 radio maintenance fee 8,198.97
Total for Check Number 18790: 10,931.96

18791  MoreTad Tad Morelock 09/11/2025
GiffordReim25 strike team reimbursement 947.00
Total for Check Number 18791: 947.00

18792  BBTeleph American Telephone 09/11/2025
1291 emergency phone service 74.00
Total for Check Number 18792: 74.00

18793  UniTech United Tech Ultra Pure Inc. 09/11/2025
16194 282 tank rental - July 25.00
16196 283 tank rental - July 25.00
16198 281 tank rental - July 25.00
16441 282 tank rental - September 25.00
16579 283 tank rental - September 25.00
16580 281 tank rental - September 25.00
29134 281 tank service, refill 320.08
29135 282 tank service, refill 320.08
29136 283 tank service, refill 320.08
Total for Check Number 18793: 1,110.24

18794  ZieglerA Al Ziegler 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for Check Number 18794: 130.00

18795  AmbDiAnd Diana Andrews 09/11/2025
22-1201 ambulance refund/overpayment 340.00
Total for Check Number 18795: 340.00

18796  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/11/2025
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 4


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CitMartA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=McHarg
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountWat
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CurrPete
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCInnov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MoreTad
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBTeleph
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UniTech
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ZieglerA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbDiAnd
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

60 TC electric service 636.01
Total for Check Number 18796: 636.01

18797  Grizzly Big Bear Grizzly 09/11/2025
35002 July and August Big Bear Now Ads 266.00
Total for Check Number 18797: 266.00

18798  BBTract Big Bear Traction 09/11/2025
674 tire chains 2,072.49
Total for Check Number 18798: 2,072.49

18799  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Char281Int25 281 Internet 1,399.00
Total for Check Number 18799: 1,399.00

18800  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Char281TVSept25 281 TV 174.37
Total for Check Number 18800: 174.37

18801  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Char281VMSept25 281 internet/voice 490.13
Total for Check Number 18801: 490.13

18802  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Char282VMSept25 282 internet/voice 490.13
Total for Check Number 18802: 490.13

18803  Charter Charter Communications 09/11/2025
Char283TV25 283 TV 144.32
Total for Check Number 18803: 144.32

18804  CitFrank Gene Frank 09/11/2025
BFA25A831 citation payment refund, paid twice 208.80
Total for Check Number 18804: 208.80

18805  Frontier Frontier Communications 09/11/2025
Front281Sept25 281 fax line 157.71
Total for Check Number 18805: 157.71

18806 UHCRecov United Health Care 09/11/2025
22-297204 ambulance refund/overpayment 572.52
Total for Check Number 18806: 572.52

18807  RussoJ John J Russo 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for Check Number 18807: 130.00

18808  CotiKais Cotiviti Healthcare Kaiser 09/11/2025
24-68769 ambulance refund/overpayment 1,963.23
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 5


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Grizzly
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBTract
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CitFrank
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UHCRecov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RussoJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CotiKais

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18808: 1,963.23

18809  KlarK Kevin Klar 09/11/2025
GoldFireReim25 Gold Fire Reimbursement 18.20
Total for Check Number 18809: 18.20

18810  WalshLa Larry Walsh 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 390.00
Total for Check Number 18810: 390.00

18811  LifeAssi Life Assist Inc 09/11/2025
LIfeAssistAug25 V's 961.20
Total for Check Number 18811: 961.20

18812  CounTeam Nancy K. Bohl Inc 09/11/2025
INV106118 employee support services 840.00
Total for Check Number 18812: 840.00

18813 KBHR Parallel Broadcasting Inc 09/11/2025
1580004766 radio ambulance membership ad 231.40
Total for Check Number 18813: 231.40

18814  MountBev Randy J. Spitz 09/11/2025
28114 beverage supply service 265.40
Total for Check Number 18814: 265.40

18815 HerrR Rick Herrick 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 260.00
Total for Check Number 18815: 260.00

18816 RRowe Robert Rowe 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 390.00
Total for Check Number 18816: 390.00

18817 Rowelo JoKay Rowe 09/11/2025
BoardStipAug25 Board Stipend August 2025 130.00
Total for Check Number 18817: 130.00

18818  SBCFuel San Bernardino County - Fleet Managemen 09/11/2025
FLT25/26 -020 Fuel- ambulance 4,433.43
FLT25/26 -020 Fuel- Fire 5,177.74
FLT25/26 -020 Fuel- prevention 316.58
Total for Check Number 18818: 9,927.75

18819 SBCERA SBC Employees' Retirement Association ~ 09/11/2025
25GASB68RD professional services 2,462.60
Total for Check Number 18819: 2,462.60

18820  MoreTad Tad Morelock 09/11/2025
StrikeReimSep25 Little Fire, Peak Fire reimbursement 646.30
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 6


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KlarK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=WalshLa
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=LifeAssi
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CounTeam
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KBHR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountBev
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HerrR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RRowe
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RoweJo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCFuel
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCERA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MoreTad

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18820: 646.30

18821 USBank US Bank Corporate Payment Systems 09/16/2025
AugustCaclard25 fleet maintenance-fire 1,398.58
AugustCaclard25 Onstar 67.99
AugustCaclard25 mutual aid travel 10,097.63
AugustCaclard25 memberships and dues- Calchiefs 1,026.00
AugustCaclard25 postage 8.54
AugustCaclard25 mutual aid fuel 503.36
AugustCaclard25 fuel 294.47
AugustCaclard25 license renewals, training courses 1,502.02
AugustCaclard25 fleet maintenance 43.13
AugustCaclard25 building maintenance return -130.47
AugustCaclard25 Transunion,various software and license renewal 1,192.31
AugustCaclard25 travel 619.75
AugustCaclard25 household supplies 27.11
AugustCaclard25 bullet proof vests 2,100.88
AugustCaclard25 stamps.com 30.99
AugustCaclard25 board meeting meals 283.55
Total for Check Number 18821: 19,065.84

18822  AthensAD Athens Administrator 09/12/2025
09092025 WC Overpayment 3,840.66
Total for Check Number 18822: 3,840.66

18823  AmeriFid American Fidelity Assurance 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am Fidelity After Tax PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am 2,831.45
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Long & Short Term Di. PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Lon, 182.56
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Life Ins Flight PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Life 47.04
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am Fidelity After Tax PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am 2,831.45
PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am Fidelity Pre Tax PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am 854.96
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am Fidelity Pre Tax PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am 854.96
PP19 Adj PP19 Adjustment 164.74
Total for Check Number 18823: 7,767.16

18824  AmerFlex American Fidelity Assurance Company 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.07.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00001.07.2025 Am 971.66
PR Batch 00002.07.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00002.07.2025 Am 971.66
Total for Check Number 18824: 1,943.32

18825  AmerFlex American Fidelity Assurance Company 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Am 971.66
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Am 971.66
Total for Check Number 18825: 1,943.32

18826  Ameritas Anmeritas Life Insurance Corp 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Vision ER PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Visi 855.00
PP19 Adj PP19 Vision Adjustment 37.12
Total for Check Number 18826: 892.12

18827  Ameritas Ameritas Life Insurance Corp 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Dental ER PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Den 6,317.00
PP19 Adj PP19 Dental Adjustment 101.00

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 7


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=USBank
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AthensAD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmeriFid
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmerFlex
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmerFlex
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ameritas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ameritas

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18827: 6,418.00

18828 IAFF IAFF-MERP 09/12/2025
Aug 2025 August Payment 12,500.10
Total for Check Number 18828: 12,500.10

18829  Kaiser Public Agency Coalition Enterprise. ATTN 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Health ER Kaiser PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Hea 7,165.30
PP19 Adj PP19 Adjustment -1,014.47
PP19 Adjust PP19 Adjustment 3,601.94
Total for Check Number 18829: 9,752.77

18830 Keenan Keenan & Associates 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Health ER EPO PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Hea 107,430.95
PP19 Adj PP19 Adjustment 12,095.64
Total for Check Number 18830: 119,526.59

18831 Lincoln Lincoln National Life Insurance Co (5H-26 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Lincoln 457 Percentage PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Linc 1,416.09
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Lincoln Roth Flat Amc PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Linc 75.00
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Lincoln 457 Flat Amot PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Linc 500.00
Total for Check Number 18831: 1,991.09

18832  MidAmeri MidAmerica Admin & Retirement Solution 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Apple 457 Paid Call Pz PR Batch 00001.09.2025 App 380.54
Total for Check Number 18832: 380.54

18833  MidAmeri MidAmerica Admin & Retirement Solution 09/12/2025
0316337 Admin and Platform Fees 1,521.00
Total for Check Number 18833: 1,521.00

18834  NatRetSo Nationwide Retirement Solution 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nationwide Roth Flat PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nati 660.00
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nationwide Percentage PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nati 6,838.19
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nationwide Roth Perce PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nati 399.75
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nationwide Flat Amou PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Nati 3,035.00
Total for Check Number 18834: 10,932.94

18835  SBCProFF San Bernardino County Professional Firefig 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Union Dues Local 935 PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Unic 2,617.83
Total for Check Number 18835: 2,617.83

18836  ReliStan Reliance Standard Life Insurance Co. 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Life and AD and D ER PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Life 728.00
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Long Term Disability PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Lon, 816.01
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Short Term Disability PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Shor 1,284.80
PP19 Adj PP19 Adjustment -1,112.95
Total for Check Number 18836: 1,715.86

18837 SBCERA SBC Employees' Retirement Association ~ 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBCERA EE Adjustme PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBC 216.49
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Survivor SBCERA ER PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Sury 22.75

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 8


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IAFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Kaiser
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Keenan
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Lincoln
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MidAmeri
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MidAmeri
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NatRetSo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCProFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ReliStan
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCERA

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Survivor SBCERA Em PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Sury 22.75
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBCERA EE Safety Ti PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBC 13,400.01
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBCERA EE Tier 2 PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBC 16,213.05
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBCERA ER Contribu PR Batch 00001.09.2025 SBC 103,675.51
Total for Check Number 18837: 133,550.56

18838  Texas Texas Life Insurance Company 09/12/2025
PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Texas Life Ins Post Tax PR Batch 00003.07.2025 Tex: 133.06
PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Texas Life Ins Post Tax PR Batch 00001.08.2025 Tex: 133.06
Total for Check Number 18838: 266.12

18839 VVCDF 09/18/2025
EMC(C2526-0002 BLS /CPR Ecerts for classes and staff 1,100.00
Total for Check Number 18839: 1,100.00

18840  AllStar All Star Fire Equipment 09/18/2025
267049 4 cancer free turnouts, suspenders 17,313.27
Total for Check Number 18840: 17,313.27

18841 AmazNew Amazon Capital Services 09/18/2025
1X6X-KMTK-D31L  reflective tape for helmets 53.87
1X6X-KMTK-D31L file folders, legal pads 41.86
1X6X-KMTK-D31L  dish soap. sponges,clorox wipes 25.75
Total for Check Number 18841: 121.48

18842  AmazNew Amazon Capital Services 09/18/2025
INLD-HJFX-DXDI1  station supplies and toiletries 485.34
Total for Check Number 18842: 485.34

18843  Thomgas AmeriGas 09/18/2025
3181146234 284 propane 333.42
Total for Check Number 18843: 333.42

18844 ATT AT&T 09/18/2025
287328242433X09 long distance phone service 199.78
Total for Check Number 18844: 199.78

18845  AutoZone AutoZone 09/18/2025
AutoZoneAug25 2806 light bulb 8.18
AutoZoneAug25 headlights. light bulbs 144.50
Total for Check Number 18845: 152.68

18846 BBK Best Best & Krieger 09/18/2025
1039040 general matters 13,151.70
1039041 labor matters 4,071.36
1039042 miscellaneous services 594.00
Total for Check Number 18846: 17,817.06

18847 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/18/2025
CSD282AwtrAug25 282 aux water service 513.46
CSD282wtrAug25 282 water service 967.98

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 9


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Texas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=VVCDF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AllStar
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Thomgas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ATT
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AutoZone
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18847: 1,481.44

18848 04DWP CBBL Dept of Water 09/18/2025
DWP281Aug25 281 water service 3.96
Total for Check Number 18848: 3.96

18849  ConnPump Connelly Pumping Services, LLC 09/18/2025
31678 284 holding tank 200.00
Total for Check Number 18849: 200.00

18850  Cypher Cypheron Healthcare Solutions 09/18/2025
C-25-226030 ambulance billing service 13,495.88
Total for Check Number 18850: 13,495.88

18851 DTA David Taussig & Associates 09/18/2025
2508110 professional services 1,054.46
Total for Check Number 18851: 1,054.46

18852 DLL De Lage Landen Financial Services, INC ~ 09/18/2025
592109759 office copier lease 78.34
Total for Check Number 18852: 78.34

18853  ReNewell ReNewell Fleet Services 09/18/2025
7623 ME 9726 4,016.19
Total for Check Number 18853: 4,016.19

18854  GinosT Gino's Tire and Auto 09/18/2025
242163 mount and balance 164.00
Total for Check Number 18854: 164.00

18855 DIY Lumber City Corp 09/18/2025
DIYAug2025 propane 78.46
DIYAug2025 chains, locks, toilet seat, soap dispenser, handle 357.24
DIYAug2025 ARV repair 50.49
Total for Check Number 18855: 486.19

18856  MissLin Mission Linen Supply 09/18/2025
524348176 shop linen service 44.10
524430243 shop linen service 39.63
Total for Check Number 18856: 83.73

18857  Ninjio Ninjio LLC 09/18/2025
INV11987 computer safety training 71.25
Total for Check Number 18857: 71.25

18858  CitRo25 Ella Rowe 09/18/2025
BFA25A1215 citation reimbursement 416.00
Total for Check Number 18858: 416.00

18859 NAPA Superior Automotive Warehouse 09/18/2025
110278 ambulance filters 1,657.19
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 10


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=04DWP
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ConnPump
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Cypher
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DTA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DLL
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ReNewell
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=GinosT
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DIY
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MissLin
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ninjio
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CitRo25
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NAPA

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18859: 1,657.19

18860  Uline Uline, Inc. 09/18/2025
195191853 283 storage cabinet 1,705.05
Total for Check Number 18860: 1,705.05

18861  UniTech United Tech Ultra Pure Inc. 09/18/2025
3000 282 water tank 320.08
Total for Check Number 18861: 320.08

18862  FirstAid Accurate First Aid Services, LLC 09/25/2025
C-3043 roller gauze, eye wash, butterfly closures 150.41
Total for Check Number 18862: 150.41

18863 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/25/2025
BVES282aSept25 282 aux electric service 245.67
Total for Check Number 18863: 245.67

18864 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/25/2025
BVESmrgSept25 moonrdige electric service 96.46
Total for Check Number 18864: 96.46

18865 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/25/2025
BVES282Sept25 282 electric service 2,822.79
Total for Check Number 18865: 2,822.79

18866 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 09/25/2025
BVES283Sept25 283 electric service 1,046.80
Total for Check Number 18866: 1,046.80

18867 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/25/2025
59 GASB 68 359.09
Total for Check Number 18867: 359.09

18868 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/25/2025
CSDTCAugust25 Training Center dumpster service 121.88
Total for Check Number 18868: 121.88

18869 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/25/2025
CSD282AAugust25 282 aux dumpster service 369.64
Total for Check Number 18869: 369.64

18870  5S5BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 09/25/2025
CSD283August25 283 dumpster service 121.88
Total for Check Number 18870: 121.88

18871  JPIARegi California JPIA 09/25/2025
JPIAOct2025 Fire Workers Comp 45,126.00
JPIAOct2025 Ambulance liability Insurance 5,285.00
JPIAOct2025 Ambulance Workers Comp 15,042.00
JPIAOct2025 Fire liability Insurance 15,855.00
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 11


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Uline
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UniTech
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=FirstAid
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=JPIARegi

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18871: 81,308.00

18872 DLL De Lage Landen Financial Services, INC ~ 09/25/2025
592354059 officec copier lease 671.79
Total for Check Number 18872: 671.79

18873 ICEMA Inland Counties Emergency Medical Agenc 09/25/2025
26-054 FY 25/26 2nd quarter admin fee 5,238.23
Total for Check Number 18873: 5,238.23

18874  SafetyK Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. 09/25/2025
281 parts washer supplies 293.79
Total for Check Number 18874: 293.79

18875 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWGBBAugust25 Boulder Bay aux natural gas 11.00
Total for Check Number 18875: 11.00

18876  SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWG283 August25 283 aux natural gas 42.26
Total for Check Number 18876: 42.26

18877 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWGBBAugust25 moonrige aux natural gas 16.90
Total for Check Number 18877: 16.90

18878 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWG281August25 281 natural gas 134.41
Total for Check Number 18878: 134.41

18879 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWG285August25 285 natural gas 75.32
Total for Check Number 18879: 75.32

18880 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWGtrnBAugust25 traning center B natural gas 11.00
Total for Check Number 18880: 11.00

18881 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWGtrncAugust25 training center C natural gas 11.00
Total for Check Number 18881: 11.00

18882 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 09/25/2025
SWG282August25 282 natural gas 226.80
Total for Check Number 18882: 226.80

18883  VeriWire Verizon Wireless 09/25/2025
6123317407 cell phone service 2,155.24
Total for Check Number 18883: 2,155.24
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 12


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DLL
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ICEMA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SafetyK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=VeriWire

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

18884  ANTBCros Lamont Hanley & Associate 10/02/2025
22-97620 ambulance refund - Kendra Rasmussen 5,389.11
Total for Check Number 18884: 5,389.11

18885  ZieglerA Al Ziegler 10/02/2025
BoardSipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18885: 130.00

18886  AlexM Alex Marshall 10/02/2025
TransreimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 14.17
Total for Check Number 18886: 14.17

18887 AmazNew Amazon Capital Services 10/02/2025
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6  pocket thermometer, struts, shocks 209.19
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6  push button lever return -483.69
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6  kitchen supplies 45.21
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6 fit testing supplies 119.85
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6  USB adapters, routers, magnetic phone cooler, si 774.90
1XJJ--MW64-CWW6 narcotic safe, excerise equipment 239.62
Total for Check Number 18887: 905.08

18888  BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/02/2025
BVES 285 electric service 1,028.87
Total for Check Number 18888: 1,028.87

18889 BBK Best Best & Krieger 10/02/2025
1040035 professional services- general matters 411.60
Total for Check Number 18889: 411.60

18890  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/02/2025
CSD282dumpSep25 282 dumpster service 369.64
Total for Check Number 18890: 369.64

18891 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/02/2025
CSD283dumpSep25 283 dumpster service 121.88
Total for Check Number 18891: 121.88

18892  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/02/2025
CSD285wtrSept25 285 water service 135.38
Total for Check Number 18892: 135.38

18893  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/02/2025
CSDTCdumpSep25 TC dumpster service 121.88
Total for Check Number 18893: 121.88

18894  AmbBoogB Betty Boogren 10/02/2025
24-341462 ambulance refund 150.00
Total for Check Number 18894: 150.00

18895 BCarp Brandon Carpenter 10/02/2025
explorerReimb25 explorer livescan reimbursement 50.00
transreimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 16.49
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 13


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ANTBCros
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ZieglerA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AlexM
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbBoogB
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BCarp

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18895: 66.49

18896  MeleB Brittany Melendez 10/02/2025
TransReimnAug25 transfer meal reimbursement 20.00
TransReimnAug25 transfer meal reimbursement 19.25
Total for Check Number 18896: 39.25

18897  Cauth]J Jordyn Cauthron 10/02/2025
TransReimbSept2 transfer meal reimbursement 15.94
Total for Check Number 18897: 15.94

18898  Charter Charter Communications 10/02/2025
Chart282TVOCt25 282 Tv service 633.40
Total for Check Number 18898: 633.40

18899  Charter Charter Communications 10/02/2025
Chart284VMOCt25 284 phone service 159.79
Total for Check Number 18899: 159.79

18900 DataT Data Ticket Inc 10/02/2025
183681 citation processing 4,819.49
Total for Check Number 18900: 4,819.49

18901  EspiD Daniel Espinoza 10/02/2025
TransReimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 16.65
Total for Check Number 18901: 16.65

18902  FloreP Philip Flores 10/02/2025
transreimb2025 transfer meal reimbursement 15.00
Total for Check Number 18902: 15.00

18903  Frontier Frontier Communications 10/02/2025
Front283phOct25 283 phone service 269.10
Total for Check Number 18903: 269.10

18904 UHCRecov United Health Care 10/02/2025
22-206218 ambulance refund - Christopher McDade 214.17
Total for Check Number 18904: 214.17

18905 RussoJ John J Russo 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18905: 130.00

18906 FoxKen Kenneth Fox 10/02/2025
RecertReimb2025 paramedic recert reimbursement 250.00
Total for Check Number 18906: 250.00

18907 AmbKingM Mary King 10/02/2025
25-83106 ambulance refund 125.17
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 14


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MeleB
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CauthJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DataT
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=EspiD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=FloreP
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UHCRecov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RussoJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=FoxKen
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbKingM

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18907: 125.17

18908  WalshLa Larry Walsh 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18908: 130.00

18909  MissLin Mission Linen Supply 10/02/2025
524515841 shop linen service 44.10
524597997 shop linen service 37.15
524691531 shop linen service 44.95
Total for Check Number 18909: 126.20

18910  MercadoN Nicholas Mercado 10/02/2025
transreimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 13.09
Total for Check Number 18910: 13.09

18911 MountBev Randy J. Spitz 10/02/2025
28121 beverage supply service 277.87
Total for Check Number 18911: 277.87

18912  HerrR Rick Herrick 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18912: 130.00

18913  RRowe Robert Rowe 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18913: 130.00

18914  StapR Robert Stapp 10/02/2025
ExplorReimb25 explorer livescan reimbursement 47.00
Total for Check Number 18914: 47.00

18915 Rowelo JoKay Rowe 10/02/2025
BoardStipSept25 September 2025 Board Stipend 130.00
Total for Check Number 18915: 130.00

18916 SBCInnov Innovation & Technology Dept. San Bernar 10/02/2025
31322 radio maintenance -ambulance 8,359.89
31322 radio maintenance -fire 2,786.63
Total for Check Number 18916: 11,146.52

18917 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/02/2025
SWG@G282Sept25 282 natural gas service 67.53
Total for Check Number 18917: 67.53

18918  BBTeleph American Telephone 10/02/2025
1334 emergency phone service 74.00
Total for Check Number 18918: 74.00

18919  TGuyon Tyler Guyon 10/02/2025
transreimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 19.76
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 15


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=WalshLa
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MissLin
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MercadoN
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountBev
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HerrR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RRowe
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=StapR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=RoweJo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCInnov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBTeleph
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=TGuyon

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18919: 19.76

18920  SchlossW William Schlosser 10/02/2025
ExplorerReimb25 explorer livescan reimbursement 49.00
Total for Check Number 18920: 49.00

18921  SnellWil Snell & Wilmer 10/02/2025
99800.00001 professional services 2,500.00
Total for Check Number 18921: 2,500.00

18922  WardZac Zachary Ward 10/02/2025
TransreimbSep25 transfer meal reimbursement 7.14
Total for Check Number 18922: 7.14

18923  SoTire Southern Tire Mart 10/09/2025
7060019742 amulance tires 1,788.35
7060019743 WT-281 tires and installation 4,208.97
7060019747 ME-9726 valve stem repair 397.92
Total for Check Number 18923: 6,395.24

18924  BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/09/2025
BVES281Sept25 281 electric service 3,590.64
Total for Check Number 18924: 3,590.64

18925  Grizzly Big Bear Grizzly 10/09/2025
35477 BB Now ad -ambulance program 133.00
Total for Check Number 18925: 133.00

18926  Bound Bound Tree Medical, LLC 10/09/2025
BoundTreeSept25 saline, catheters, gloves, 02 masks, needles, med 15,901.71
Total for Check Number 18926: 15,901.71

18927  caltool CTWS LLC 10/09/2025
DK9389 281 oxygen and helium 307.50
DK9390 282 oxygen 240.00
Total for Check Number 18927: 547.50

18928 DAC DAC Automated Gates & Garage Doors LI 10/09/2025
2394 bay door repair at 282 2,100.00
Total for Check Number 18928: 2,100.00

18929  HutchinD Dawn Hutchinson 10/09/2025
GarnetReimb25 Garnet Fire Reimbursement 441.00
Total for Check Number 18929: 441.00

18930  FisherJ John Fisher 10/09/2025
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 1,875.64
Total for Check Number 18930: 1,875.64

18931  Frontier Frontier Communications 10/09/2025
Front282A0ct25 282 aux phone service 77.99
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 16


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SchlossW
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SnellWil
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=WardZac
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SoTire
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Grizzly
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Bound
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=caltool
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DAC
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HutchinD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=FisherJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18931: 77.99

18932  Frontier Frontier Communications 10/09/2025
Front2820ct25 282 phone service 79.34
Total for Check Number 18932: 79.34

18933  Frontier Frontier Communications 10/09/2025
Front28iFxOct25 281 fax phone service 78.76
Total for Check Number 18933: 78.76

18934 ICEMA Inland Counties Emergency Medical Agenc 10/09/2025
26-067 FY 25/26 control and compliance fees 7,000.00
Total for Check Number 18934: 7,000.00

18935  Dmyt] Jason Dmytriw 10/09/2025
TagReimbSept25 accountability tags 217.50
Total for Check Number 18935: 217.50

18936  KlarK Kevin Klar 10/09/2025
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 1,501.26
Total for Check Number 18936: 1,501.26

18937  LifeAssi Life Assist Inc 10/09/2025
92314FDSept25 02 sensors, nasopharyngeal airways, sterile wate: 2,118.37
Total for Check Number 18937: 2,118.37

18938 DIY Lumber City Corp 10/09/2025
DIYSept2025 padlock, push broom, station lights 102.31
DIYSept2025 BBq brush, pellets 69.21
Total for Check Number 18938: 171.52

18939  TownM Michael Towns 10/09/2025
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 91.39
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 489.19
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 335.89
DillonReimb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 782.70
LittleReimb25 Little Fire Reimbursement 244.60
LittleReimb25 Little Fire Reimbursement 113.43
Total for Check Number 18939: 2,057.20

18940  MountWat Mountain Water Company LLC 10/09/2025
95629-1105 bottled water service 16.00
Total for Check Number 18940: 16.00

18941 CounTeam Nancy K. Bohl Inc 10/09/2025
INV106567 employee support services 840.00
Total for Check Number 18941: 840.00

18942 NAPA BB NAPA Auto Parts 10/09/2025
NApaBBSept25 battery, ball joint, wipers, wiper fluid 459.23
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 17


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ICEMA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DmytJ
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KlarK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=LifeAssi
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DIY
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=TownM
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountWat
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CounTeam
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NAPA BB

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18942: 459.23

18943 KBHR Parallel Broadcasting Inc 10/09/2025
1590004766 ambulance membership radio ad 231.40
Total for Check Number 18943: 231.40

18944  Neopost Quadient Finance USA,Inc 10/09/2025
QuadientSept25 postage- fire 151.10
QuadientSept25 postage-ambulance 17.63
QuadientSept25 postage- prevention 83.11
Total for Check Number 18944: 251.84

18945 Rim Rim Forest Lumber 10/09/2025
2509-630796 chainsaw oil and parts 219.69
Total for Check Number 18945: 219.69

18946  SBCFuel San Bernardino County - Fleet Managemen 10/09/2025
FLT25/26-037 fuel-prevention 257.63
FLT25/26-037 fuel-ambulance 2,517.80
FLT25/26-037 fuel-fire 5,874.33
Total for Check Number 18946: 8,649.76

18947 NAPA Superior Automotive Warchouse 10/09/2025
NapaSupSept25 oil, filters, socket, belt, GAT coupling 402.38
Total for Check Number 18947: 402.38

18948  MoreTad Tad Morelock 10/09/2025
GarnetReimb25 Garnet Fire Reimbursement 1,567.60
Total for Check Number 18948: 1,567.60

18949  UniTech United Tech Ultra Pure Inc. 10/09/2025
16587 282 water tank rental 25.00
16597 283 water tank rental 25.00
16598 281 water tank rental 25.00
Total for Check Number 18949: 75.00

18950  WalkN Norman Walker 10/09/2025
DillonReimbb25 Dillon Fire Reimbursement 188.00
Total for Check Number 18950: 188.00

18951 USBank US Bank Corporate Payment Systems 10/14/2025
SeptCalcard2025 maintenance supplies for equipment testing 2,079.12
SeptCalcard2025 FasTrak 30.00
SeptCalcard2025 board and chief's meeting 175.65
SeptCalcard2025 station cleaning supplies 259.45
SeptCalcard2025 mutual aid travel 1,073.98
SeptCalcard2025 mutual aid fuel 415.23
SeptCalcard2025 explorer program and career day supplies 378.20
SeptCalcard2025 license renewals 300.00
SeptCalcard2025 transunion, starlink, onstar 696.99
SeptCalcard2025 boots and uniform stitching 232.44
SeptCalcard2025 postage and PO box annual renewal 637.80
SeptCalcard2025 vehicle maintenance 333.63

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 18


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KBHR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Neopost
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Rim
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCFuel
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NAPA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MoreTad
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UniTech
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=WalkN
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=USBank

18961 ATT

AT&T 10/16/2025

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount

Invoice No Description Reference
SeptCalcard2025 fuel 513.65
SeptCalcard2025 mutual aid expenses 2,271.72
SeptCalcard2025 stamps.com 30.99
SeptCalcard2025 career day, explorer program items 390.97
SeptCalcard2025 training and education classes 1,145.44
Total for Check Number 18951: 10,965.26

18952  Lincoln Lincoln National Life Insurance Co (5H-26 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Lincoln Roth Flat Ama PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Linc 75.00
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Lincoln 457 Percentage PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Linc 1,239.64
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Lincoln 457 Flat Amotv PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Linc 500.00
Total for Check Number 18952: 1,814.64

18953  MidAmeri MidAmerica Admin & Retirement Solution 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Apple 457 Paid Call Pz PR Batch 00002.09.2025 App 380.54
Total for Check Number 18953: 380.54

18954  NatRetSo Nationwide Retirement Solution 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nationwide Roth Perce PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nati 416.11
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nationwide Roth Flat PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nati 660.00
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nationwide Percentage PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nati 8,119.81
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nationwide Flat Amou PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Nati 3,125.00
Total for Check Number 18954: 12,320.92

18955  SBCProFF San Bernardino County Professional Firefig 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Union Dues Local 935 PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Unic 2,617.83
Total for Check Number 18955: 2,617.83

18956 SBCERA SBC Employees' Retirement Association ~ 09/26/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Survivor SBCERA ER PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Sury 22.75
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBCERA EE Tier 2 PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBC 16,026.21
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBCERA EE Safety Ti PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBC 13,185.51
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Survivor SBCERA Em PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Sury 22.75
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBCERA ER Contribu PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBC 102,235.98
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBCERA EE Adjustme¢ PR Batch 00002.09.2025 SBC 86.30
PP20 Adj PP20 Adjustment -239.01
Total for Check Number 18956: 131,340.49

18958 2Hot 2 HotUniforms, Inc 10/16/2025
97285 work shirts 1,518.15
Total for Check Number 18958: 1,518.15

18959  AmazNew Amazon Capital Services 10/16/2025
1F34-Y7MP-7GQF paper towels 17.22
1F34-Y7MP-7GQF uniform repair kit 9.68
1F34-Y7MP-7GQF sharpies, pens, receipt books, folders, post its 458.40
Total for Check Number 18959: 485.30

18960  AmazNew Amazon Capital Services 10/16/2025
1C6X-TVRM-L3YM  detergent, paper towels, dish soap, trash bags 207.75
Total for Check Number 18960: 207.75

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 19


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Lincoln
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MidAmeri
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NatRetSo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCProFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCERA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=2Hot
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ATT

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

X10102025 long distance phone service 165.29
Total for Check Number 18961: 165.29

18962 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/16/2025
BVES284recon25 FY 25/26 solar reconciliation 6,335.19
Total for Check Number 18962: 6,335.19

18963 BVPrint Bear Valley Printing 10/16/2025
11809 prevention banners 495.65
Total for Check Number 18963: 495.65

18964 BVPrint Bear Valley Printing 10/16/2025
11810 performance evaluation cards 116.84
Total for Check Number 18964: 116.84

18965 BBK Best Best & Krieger 10/16/2025
1042274 professional services- labor matters 1,496.40
Total for Check Number 18965: 1,496.40

18966 BBK Best Best & Krieger 10/16/2025
1042273 professional services- general matters 9,687.42
Total for Check Number 18966: 9,687.42

18967 BBK Best Best & Krieger 10/16/2025
1042275 professional services-miscellaneous 653.40
Total for Check Number 18967: 653.40

18968 BBK Best Best & Krieger 10/16/2025
1042275 professional services- labor matters 346.20
Total for Check Number 18968: 346.20

18969 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/16/2025
62 TC electric service 614.95
Total for Check Number 18969: 614.95

18970  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/16/2025
CSD283wtrOct25 283 water service 123.14
Total for Check Number 18970: 123.14

18971 55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/16/2025
CSDTCwtrOct25 TC water service 99.71
Total for Check Number 18971: 99.71

18972  JPIARegi California JPIA 10/16/2025
JPIANov2025 liability insurance -ambulance 5,285.00
JPIANo0v2025 workers comp - ambulance 15,042.00
JPIANo0v2025 workers comp - fire 45,126.00
JPIANov2025 liability insurance -fire 15,855.00
Total for Check Number 18972: 81,308.00

18973  04DWP CBBL Dept of Water 10/16/2025
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 20


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVPrint
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVPrint
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBK
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=JPIARegi
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=04DWP

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

DWP281wtrOct25 281 water service 453.26
Total for Check Number 18973: 453.26

18974 04DWP CBBL Dept of Water 10/16/2025
DWPmrgwtrOct25 moonridge water service 54.84
Total for Check Number 18974: 54.84

18975  Charter Charter Communications 10/16/2025
ChartOct2811T25 281 internet 1,399.00
Total for Check Number 18975: 1,399.00

18976  Charter Charter Communications 10/16/2025
ChartOct282VM25 282 internet/voice 490.13
Total for Check Number 18976: 490.13

18977  Charter Charter Communications 10/16/2025
ChartOct283TV25 283 TV 144.32
Total for Check Number 18977: 144.32

18978  Charter Charter Communications 10/16/2025
ChartOct281TV25 281 TV 174.37
Total for Check Number 18978: 174.37

18979  Charter Charter Communications 10/16/2025
ChartOct281VM25 281 internet/voice 490.13
Total for Check Number 18979: 490.13

18980  ConnPump Connelly Pumping Services, LLC 10/16/2025
31751 284 holding tank 200.00
Total for Check Number 18980: 200.00

18981  CrossCom Cross Connections Emergency Services IN( 10/16/2025
2024-5-30-BBF radios, chargers, batteries, antennas 6,791.99
Total for Check Number 18981: 6,791.99

18982  CrossCom Cross Connections Emergency Services IN( 10/16/2025
2024-1-2-BBF radio, charger, batteries, antenna 3,580.81
Total for Check Number 18982: 3,580.81

18983  caltool CTWS LLC 10/16/2025
995077 281 oxygen 358.70
Total for Check Number 18983: 358.70

18984  Image200 Image 2000 10/16/2025
786182b printer toner 15.89
Total for Check Number 18984: 15.89

18985  Image200 Image 2000 10/16/2025
803502 printer toner 16.75
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 21


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=04DWP
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ConnPump
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CrossCom
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CrossCom
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=caltool
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Image200
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Image200

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 18985: 16.75

18986  Ninjio Ninjio LLC 10/16/2025
INV12419 computer protection training 71.25
Total for Check Number 18986: 71.25

18987  Haupt Ralph W. Haupt INC 10/16/2025
100074-100075 diesel fuel 184.59
Total for Check Number 18987: 184.59

18988  MountBev Randy J. Spitz 10/16/2025
28132 beverage service 184.15
Total for Check Number 18988: 184.15

18989  AmeriFid Anmerican Fidelity Assurance 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am Fidelity Pre Tax PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am 854.96
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am Fidelity Pre Tax PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am 854.96
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am Fidelity After Tax PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am 2,831.45
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Life Ins Flight PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Life 47.04
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am Fidelity After Tax PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am 2,831.45
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Long & Short Term Di. PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Lon; 182.56
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment 272.84
Total for Check Number 18989: 7,875.26

18990  AmerFlex American Fidelity Assurance Company 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Am 871.66
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am Fidelity FSA Full PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Am 871.66
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment 200.00
Total for Check Number 18990: 1,943.32

18991  Ameritas Ameritas Life Insurance Corp 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Vision ER PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Visi 855.00
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment Vision 37.12
Total for Check Number 18991: 892.12

18992  Ameritas Ameritas Life Insurance Corp 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Dental ER PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Den 6,317.00
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment Dental 101.00
Total for Check Number 18992: 6,418.00

18993  Kaiser Public Agency Coalition Enterprise. ATTN 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Health ER Kaiser PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Hea 7,165.30
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment 2,587.47
Total for Check Number 18993: 9,752.77

18994  Keenan Keenan & Associates 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Health ER EPO PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Hea 107,430.95
PP21 Adj PP21 Adjustment 7,959.96
Total for Check Number 18994: 115,390.91

18995  Lincoln Lincoln National Life Insurance Co (5H-26 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Lincoln Roth Flat Ama PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Linc 75.00

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 22


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ninjio
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Haupt
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountBev
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmeriFid
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmerFlex
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ameritas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Ameritas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Kaiser
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Keenan
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Lincoln

Check No  Vendor No
Invoice No

Vendor Name Check Date
Description Reference

Check Amount

18996  MidAmeri

18997  NatRetSo

18998  SBCProFF

18999  ReliStan

PP21 Adj

19000 SBCERA

PP21 Adj

19001  Texas

19002  AmbEquia
25-27889

19003  AmazNew
1M13-CJGH-LC3T
1M13-CJGH-LC3T
1M13-CJGH-LC3T
1M13-CJGH-LC3T
1M13-CJGH-LC3T

PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Lincoln 457 Percentage PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Linc
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Lincoln 457 Flat Amot PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Linc

Total for Check Number 18995:

MidAmerica Admin & Retirement Solution 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Apple 457 Paid Call P PR Batch 00001.10.2025 App

Total for Check Number 18996:

Nationwide Retirement Solution 10/10/2025

PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nationwide Flat Amou PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nati
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nationwide Roth Perce PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nati
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nationwide Roth Flat PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nati
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nationwide Percentage PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Nati

Total for Check Number 18997:

San Bernardino County Professional Firefig 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Union Dues Local 935 PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Unic

Total for Check Number 18998:

Reliance Standard Life Insurance Co. 10/10/2025

PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Short Term Disability PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Sho:
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Long Term Disability PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Lon;
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Life and AD and D ER PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Life
PP21 Adjustment

Total for Check Number 18999:

SBC Employees' Retirement Association 10/10/2025

PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Survivor SBCERA Em PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Sury
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBCERA EE Adjustme PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBC
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBCERA EE Tier 2 PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBC
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Survivor SBCERA ER PR Batch 00001.10.2025 Sury
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBCERA EE Safety Ti PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBC
PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBCERA ER Contribu PR Batch 00001.10.2025 SBC
PP21 Adjustment

Total for Check Number 19000:

Texas Life Insurance Company 10/10/2025
PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Texas Life Ins Post Ta» PR Batch 00002.09.2025 Tex:
PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Texas Life Ins Post Tax PR Batch 00001.09.2025 Tex:

Total for Check Number 19001:

DM Trust Aetna 10/23/2025
ambulance refund

Total for Check Number 19002:

Amazon Capital Services 10/23/2025
toner cartridges

headlight assembly, grease gun, ignition switch

cleaning supplies return

wifi thermometers, ethernet cable, cable ties, usb

wildland batteries

Total for Check Number 19003:

1,402.13
500.00

1,977.13

398.45

398.45

3,225.00
530.88
660.00

5,988.27

10,404.15

2,617.83

2,617.83

1,284.80
816.01
728.00

-1,167.32

1,661.49

22.75
86.30
18,319.70
22.75
13,534.89
110,911.35
-10,089.77

132,807.97

133.06
133.06

266.12

1,799.81

1,799.81

28.85
176.50
-19.57
477.01
73.34

736.13

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 23


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MidAmeri
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NatRetSo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCProFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=ReliStan
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCERA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Texas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbEquia
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmazNew

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

19004 AmbAngD Doris Angerhofer 10/23/2025
25-14233 ambulance refund 200.00
Total for Check Number 19004: 200.00

19005 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/23/2025
BVES282a0ct25 282 aux electric service 240.09
Total for Check Number 19005: 240.09

19006 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/23/2025
BVES2820c¢t25 282 electric service 2,017.28
Total for Check Number 19006: 2,017.28

19007 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/23/2025
BVES2830ct25 283 electric service 678.05
Total for Check Number 19007: 678.05

19008 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/23/2025
BVESmoonOct25 moonridge electric service 58.07
Total for Check Number 19008: 58.07

19009 AmbBennR Rita Bennett 10/23/2025
25-103196 ambulance refund 250.00
Total for Check Number 19009: 250.00

19010 BBUrgent Big Bear Urgent Care 10/23/2025
5868 DMV Physical 120.00
Total for Check Number 19010: 120.00

19011 CSDA California Special Districts Association 10/23/2025
55189 CA Special District annual membership dues 1,872.00
Total for Check Number 19011: 1,872.00

19012  KaiserCo Kaiser Foundation Cotiviti 10/23/2025
24-53922 ambulance refund 2,303.25
Total for Check Number 19012: 2,303.25

19013  Cypher Cypheron Healthcare Solutions 10/23/2025
C-25-256008 ambulance bililng service 14,464.15
Total for Check Number 19013: 14,464.15

19014 DLL De Lage Landen Financial Services, INC 10/23/2025
592700249 office copier lease 675.79
Total for Check Number 19014: 675.79

19015  Veterans Department of Veterans Affairs 10/23/2025
23-344630 ambulance refund 259.64
Total for Check Number 19015: 259.64

19016 ~AmbEmiJ John Emig 10/23/2025
25-156009 ambulance refund 129.05
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 24


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbAngD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbBennR
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BBUrgent
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CSDA
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=KaiserCo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Cypher
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=DLL
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Veterans
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbEmiJ

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 19016: 129.05

19017 UHCRecov United Health Care 10/23/2025
23-178083 ambulance refund 565.62
Total for Check Number 19017: 565.62

19018 UHCRecov United Health Care 10/23/2025
23-18801 ambulance refund 1,786.56
Total for Check Number 19018: 1,786.56

19019 UHCRecov United Health Care 10/23/2025
23-30399 ambulance refund 214.17
Total for Check Number 19019: 214.17

19020  HeritVV Heritage Victor Valley Medical Group 10/23/2025
ck 30060030 ambulance refund 2,826.00
Total for Check Number 19020: 2,826.00

19021  AmbKedM Margo Kedzierski 10/23/2025
24-76899 ambulance refund 362.05
Total for Check Number 19021: 362.05

19022  1Kings Kings Fire Protection, Inc 10/23/2025
3266 282 extinguisher 94.82
Total for Check Number 19022: 94.82

19023 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWG@G2810ct25 281 natural gas 374.11
Total for Check Number 19023: 374.11

19024 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWG@G282a0ct25 282 aux natural gas 109.01
Total for Check Number 19024: 109.01

19025 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWG@G2820ct25 282 natural gas 307.20
Total for Check Number 19025: 307.20

19026 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWG@G2830ct25 283 natural gas 49.42
Total for Check Number 19026: 49.42

19027 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWG@G2850ct25 285 natural gas 49.46
Total for Check Number 19027: 49.46

19028 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWGBBAY Oct25 boulder bay natural gas 11.00
Total for Check Number 19028: 11.00

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 25


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UHCRecov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UHCRecov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=UHCRecov
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=HeritVV
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AmbKedM
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=1Kings
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

19029 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWGMoonOct25 moonrdige natural gas 76.17
Total for Check Number 19029: 76.17

19030 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWGTrBOct25 training center B natural gas 11.00
Total for Check Number 19030: 11.00

19031 SWGas Southwest Gas Corporation 10/23/2025
SWGTrCOct25 traiing center C natural gas 14.86
Total for Check Number 19031: 14.86

19032  Tricare Tricare East Refunds 10/23/2025
24-65820 ambulance refund 276.60
Total for Check Number 19032: 276.60

19033 VeriWire Verizon Wireless 10/23/2025
6125802134 cell phone service 1,988.61
Total for Check Number 19033: 1,988.61

19034 IAFF IAFF-MERP 10/24/2025
10242025 PP22 12,083.43
Total for Check Number 19034: 12,083.43

19035 Lincoln Lincoln National Life Insurance Co (5H-26 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Lincoln Roth Flat Amc PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Linc 75.00
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Lincoln 457 Percentage PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Linc 1,679.05
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Lincoln 457 Flat Amot PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Linc 500.00
Total for Check Number 19035: 2,254.05

19036  MidAmeri MidAmerica Admin & Retirement Solution 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Apple 457 Paid Call Pz PR Batch 00002.10.2025 App 380.54
Total for Check Number 19036: 380.54

19037 NatRetSo Nationwide Retirement Solution 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nationwide Flat Amou PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nati 3,225.00
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nationwide Roth Flat PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nati 660.00
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nationwide Percentage PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nati 5,694.02
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nationwide Roth Perce PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Nati 594.80
Total for Check Number 19037: 10,173.82

19038  SBCProFF San Bernardino County Professional Firefig 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Union Dues Local 935 PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Unic 2,527.56
Total for Check Number 19038: 2,527.56

19039 SBCERA SBC Employees' Retirement Association 10/24/2025
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Survivor SBCERA Em PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Sury 22.75
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Survivor SBCERA ER PR Batch 00002.10.2025 Sury 22.75
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBCERA EE Tier 2 PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBC 15,237.59
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBCERA EE Adjustme PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBC 76.70
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBCERA ER Contribu PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBC 98,793.55
PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBCERA EE Safety Ti PR Batch 00002.10.2025 SBC 12,943.87
AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM) Page 26


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SWGas
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Tricare
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=VeriWire
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=IAFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Lincoln
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MidAmeri
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=NatRetSo
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCProFF
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=SBCERA

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

PP22 Adj PP22 Adj -172.43
Total for Check Number 19039: 126,924.78

19040  AllStar All Star Fire Equipment 10/30/2025
267901 structure boots (2) 808.13
Total for Check Number 19040: 808.13

19041 BVElect Bear Valley Electric Service Inc. 10/30/2025
BVES285Nov25 285 electric service 795.33
Total for Check Number 19041: 795.33

19042  55BBCSD Big Bear City CSD 10/30/2025
1286025 285 FY 25/26 BBARWA fee 630.08
Total for Check Number 19042: 630.08

19043  Charter Charter Communications 10/30/2025
Chart282TVNov25 282 TV 633.40
Total for Check Number 19043: 633.40

19044  Charter Charter Communications 10/30/2025
Chart24PHNov25 284 internet/voice 160.15
Total for Check Number 19044: 160.15

19045  CitFranT Thomas Franks Jr 10/30/2025
BFA25A836 citation refund 0.10
Total for Check Number 19045: 0.10

19046  Frontier Frontier Communications 10/30/2025
Front2830ct25 283 phone service 271.95
Total for Check Number 19046: 271.95

19047  Image200 Image 2000 10/30/2025
80825 copier usage fee 290.18
Total for Check Number 19047: 290.18

19048 LifeAssi Life Assist Inc 10/30/2025
1644423 1V's 539.29
Total for Check Number 19048: 539.29

19049  LifeAssi Life Assist Inc 10/30/2025
1648535 medical supplies for active shooter bags 714.43
Total for Check Number 19049: 714.43

19050 TownM Michael Towns 10/30/2025
DillonFire2025 Dillon Fire Travel 27.00
Total for Check Number 19050: 27.00

19051 MissLin Mission Linen Supply 10/30/2025
524777278 shop linen service 42.47
524860231 shop linen service 42.47

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 27


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=AllStar
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=BVElect
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=55BBCSD
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Charter
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=CitFranT
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Frontier
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Image200
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=LifeAssi
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=LifeAssi
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=TownM
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MissLin

Check No  Vendor No Vendor Name Check Date Check Amount
Invoice No Description Reference

Total for Check Number 19051: 84.94

19052  Butc Pinon Enterprises INC 10/30/2025
ButcherOct25 office key 6.44
ButcherOct25 toilet handles, bolts, nuts washers 14.52
Total for Check Number 19052: 20.96

19053  MountBev Randy J. Spitz 10/30/2025
28136 office beverage supply 119.63
Total for Check Number 19053: 119.63

19054  03FirCUp San Bernardino County Fire Protection Dist 10/30/2025
IN0196554 281 FY 25/26 Haz Materials fee 626.00
Total for Check Number 19054: 626.00

19055  Stryker Stryker Sales, LLC 10/30/2025
9210484100 patient sensors and cables 1,489.21
Total for Check Number 19055: 1,489.21

19056  MoreTad Tad Morelock 10/30/2025
GarnetHotel2025 Garnet Fire Hotel Reimbursement 1,181.88
Total for Check Number 19056: 1,181.88

19057  VictMoto Victorville Motors 10/30/2025
711055 MA 1520353 3,921.06
Total for Check Number 19057: 3,921.06
Report Total (305 checks): 1,732,621.04

AP Checks by Date - Detail by Check Number (12/2/2025 2:02 PM)

Page 28


http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Butc
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MountBev
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=03FirCUp
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=Stryker
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=MoreTad
http://ssi.NET?action=object&object=APVendor&id=VictMoto

Item No. FA2

BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
MINUTES FOR THE MEETING OF
November 5, 2025

A Special Meeting of the Big Bear Fire Authority was called to order by Board Chair Segovia at
5:00 p.m., Tuesday, November 5, 2025, at 41090 Big Bear Boulevard, Big Bear Lake, California.

Board Members Present: Board Chair Kendi Segovia
Vice Chair Bob Rowe
Director Rick Herrick
Director Charles Hicks
Director Perri Melnick
Director JoKay Rowe
Director John Russo
Director Larry Walsh
Director Al Ziegler

Board Members Absent: Director Randall Putz
Others Present: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief

Sherry Wentz, Interim Board Secretary
Nicholaus Norvell, Assistant Authority Counsel

OPEN SESSION
CALL TO ORDER
Moment of Silence: Observed
Pledge of Allegiance: Led by Chair Segovia
ROLL CALL

Please Note: The Chair may, at his or her discretion, take items out of order at the meeting to
facilitate the business of the Board and/or for the convenience of the public.

ANNOUNCEMENTS & UPCOMING EVENTS

The Fire Authority’s Administrative Office will be closed:
e Tuesday, November 11, 2025, in observance of Veterans Day and will re-open on
Wednesday, November 12, 2025, at 8:00 a.m.
e Thursday, November 27, 2025, in observance of Thanksgiving, and will reopen on
Monday, December 1, 2025 at 8:00 a.m.

The Big Bear Professional Firefighters Annual Snowvember (aka Stachtober) is scheduled for
Friday, November 21, 2025, at 5:00 p.m., at Sandy’s Sports Bar. Proceeds from this event go
directly back to the community.



Page 2
Fire Authority Minutes
November 5, 2025

PRESENTATIONS

Luke Wagner, Fire Chief, presented the Budget Revenue Variations
No action was taken.

DIRECTORS’ GENERAL ANNOUNCEMENTS

Director Zigler stated, “If it’s not broke...don’t fix it.”

GENERAL PUBLIC COMMENT

Jon Bidwell, President of Big Bear Professional Firefighters’ Assoc., IAFF, Local 935,
announced its fundraising campaign benefitting the Jared Landaker Memorial Foundation.
Sharing that the Association is selling Jared Landaker shirts, hats, and sweatshirts. Big
Bear resident Jared Landaker, a US Marine CH-46 Sea King helicopter pilot was killed in
action in 2007. The Foundation sponsors YMCA camps across the country benefitting
children of the military. He noted Fire Station 281 has inventory on-site should any
Director be interested.

CHIEF’S REPORT

Chief Wagner congratulated Firefighter/Paramedics Jack Gardner and Alex Marshall on
successfully passing the recent promotional test for the rank of Fire Engineer. He also
reported that per San Bernardino County Local Area Formation Commission (LAFCO),
the deadline to submit applications for its 2026 calendar is December 31, 2025. Any future
action would be at the discretion of the Board. No action was taken.

FINANCE OFFICER’S REPORT

None

FIRE AUTHORITY CONSENT CALENDAR

FA1l. Approval of Demands — Check Issue Date 08/01/25 through 08/31/25 in the
amount of $1,399,422.21

FA2. Approval of Meeting Minutes from the September 9, 2025, Regular Meeting
of the Big Bear Fire Authority.

FA3. Receive and File Big Bear Fire Authority Monthly Report for August, 2025.



Page 3

Fire Authority Minutes
November 5, 2025

FA4.

Acknowledge Receipt of Annual Inspection Report for Certain Educational
and Residential Structures

Board consideration to adopt Resolution No. BBFA2025-006 acknowledging
receipt of inspection report and designating October of each year as the assigned
time for the Board of Directors to receive the annual report for the year.

Action: A motion by Director Herrick, seconded by Director Melnick, to approve the
Consent Calendar as follows:

AYES: Ziegler, Herrick, Hicks, Melnick, B. Rowe, J. Rowe, Russo, Walsh,
Segovia
NOES: None

ABSENT: Putz
ABSTAIN: None

ITEMS REMOVED FROM THE CONSENT CALENDAR

None

PUBLIC HEARING

None

NEW BUSINESS

BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY DISCUSSION ITEMS

FAS.

Introduction of Ordinance BBFA2025-001 for Adoption of the 2025 Edition of
the California Fire Code, and the 2025 Edition of the California Residential
Code, with Changes, Amendments, Additions, Deletions, and Exceptions.

Luke Wagner, Fire Chief, presented the staff report.
Public Comments: None

Discussion ensued regarding potential impacts to the following: the use of tiki
torches, Snow Summit Resort’s annual New Year’s Eve Torchlight Parade,
building contractors, wood shake/shingle structures, structural hazard clearances,
and gas flame fire pits.

Action: A motion by Director Herrick, seconded by Board Chair Segovia, the
Board introduced and waived first reading of Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001 to
adopt the 2025 Edition of the California Fire Code with amendments, additions,
deletions, and exceptions, including penalties and the 2025 Edition of the California
Residential Code, along with certain changes, modifications, amendments,



Page 4

Fire Authority Minutes
November 5, 2025

FA6.

FAT.

additions, deletions, and exceptions, and set a public hearing for second reading
and adoption of Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001 at the Fire Authority meeting of
December 9, 2025.

Said Motion was approved by the following vote:

AYES: Herrick, Hicks, Melnick, B. Rowe, J. Rowe, Russo, Walsh,
Ziegler, Segovia
NOES: None

ABSENT: Putz
ABSTAIN: None

Tax Revenue Anticipation Note (TRAN) Authorization for Use of Additional
Funds

Luke Wagner, Fire Chief, presented the report. Kristen Mandoloni, Director of
Business Services was present to respond to questions.

Public Comments: None

Discussion ensued regarding the intended use of the TRAN funds, concern with a
potential delay in securing funds due to a new invoice processing request by the
City of Big Bear Lake, and delayed response by the City Manager concerning
clarification of the new pass-through funds invoicing process implemented by the
City.

Action: A motion by Director Herrick, seconded by Director Hicks, the Board
approved staff to withdraw the final $1 million of the approved TRAN, if needed,
directed staff to provide notification to the Board upon its use, and provide the
Board copies of email correspondence from Ms. Mandolini to the City Manager
seeking clarification on the new invoice process in securing pass-through funds.

Said Motion was approved by the following vote:

AYES: Herrick, Hicks, Melnick, B. Rowe, J. Rowe, Russo, Walsh,
Ziegler
NOES: Segovia

ABSENT: Putz
ABSTAIN: None

Fire Authority 2026 Meeting Calendar
Luke Wagner, Fire Chief, presented the proposed 2026 Meeting Calendar.

Public Comments: None



Page 5

Fire Authority Minutes
November 5, 2025

FAS.

Action: A motion by Director B. Rowe, seconded by Director Walsh, the Board
approved the proposed 2026 Fire Authority Board meeting calendar with two
Budget Workshops on April 22 and May 20, 2026.

Said Motion was approved by the following vote:

AYES: Herrick, Hicks, Melnick, B. Rowe, J. Rowe, Russo, Walsh,
Ziegler, Segovia
NOES: None

ABSENT: Putz
ABSTAIN: None

Big Bear Fire Authority Bylaws and Policies Update

Nicholaus Norvell, Assistant General Counsel of Best, Best, and Krieger, presented
the proposed changes to the Bylaws.

Public Comments: None

Discussion ensued regarding the impacts of the Brown Act on closed session
confidentiality and the need to amend the Bylaws.

Action: A motion by Director Perry, seconded by Director Herrick, the Board
discussed and approved the general counsel recommendation to include
provisions on confidentiality of closed session information under the Brown Act.

Said Motion was approved by the following vote:

AYES: Herrick, Hicks, Melnick, B. Rowe, J. Rowe, Russo, Walsh,
Ziegler, Segovia

NOES: None

ABSENT: Putz

ABSTAIN: None

COMMITTEE REPORTS

None

DIRECTORS’ CLOSING COMMENTS

Director Hicks offered his condolences on the tragic death of San Bernardino County
Sheriff’s Deputy Andrew Nunez.



Page 6
Fire Authority Minutes
November 5, 2025

CLOSED SESSION PUBLIC COMMUNICATIONS: (Any member of the public is entitled to
speak on Closed Session Agenda item. If you wish to address any other items listed on the Agenda,
you must do so during Open Session.)

The public offered no comments.

CLOSED SESSION

1. PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT
Title: Board Secretary

2. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS (GOVERNMENT CODE §
54957.6)
Agency Designated Representative(s): Luke Wagner, Fire Chief
Unrepresented Employee: Board Secretary

3. CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS (GOVERNMENT CODE §
54957.6)
Agency Designated Representative(s): Luke Wagner, Fire Chief
Employee Organization: Big Bear Professional Firefighters’ Assoc., IAFF, Local 935

4. CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL—ANTICIPATED LITIGATION
Significant exposure to litigation pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d)(2):
One (1) potential case

CLOSED SESSION

At the hour of 5:47 p.m., Board Chair Segovia adjourned to Closed Session.
At the hour of 7:53 p.m., Board Chair Segovia adjourned Closed Session.
At the hour of 7:53 p.m., Board Chair Segovia re-opened Regular Session, with no public present.

REPORT ON CLOSED SESSION

No reportable action.

ADJOURNMENT

There being no further business to come before the Fire Authority at this session, Board Chair
Segovia adjourned the meeting at 7:53 p.m.

Sherry Wentz
Interim Board Secretary



INTEROFFICE MEMO

Item No FA3a

Big Bear Fire Authority

DATE: December 9, 2025

TO: Board Chair and Directors of Big Bear Fire Authority

FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief M,}

PREPARED BY:  Chardelle Smith, Board Secretary Ofﬁ

SUBJECT: SEPTEMBER 2025 FIRE DEPARTMENT MONTHLY ACTIVITY

REPORT

1. SERVICE DELIVERY

Y ear-to-date incidents by call type percentages (see attached report)

1.1 Call types by month and year-to-date:

Current Calendar | Previous
Month YTD Year
1.2.1 | Fire Calls, Hazardous Conditions, Service Calls 96 849 1,338
1.2.2 | Rescue/Medical Calls 206 2,408 3,114
1.2.3 | Medical Flight Missions 30 458 375
1.2.4 | Training Class Summary (hours) 536.75 7,169.03 8,418.2
FIRE PREVENTION
1.2.5 | Plan Review 10 85 152
1.2.6 | Chipping Requests (2020 Suspended) -- - --
1.2.7 | Trees Removed/Reimbursed Through Grant 0 0 2
1.2.8 | Hazardous Tree Removal Notice to Proceed 0 0 3
12.9 Hazardous Tree 2"! & Final Abate Notice/Order B B i
(included in 1.2.11 and below)
1.2.10 | Tree Abatement Issues Resolved 0 13 5




September 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 2
FIRE PREVENTION CONTINUED Cl\‘l‘gfl‘:‘ﬁt Ca‘l{eT“Sar Pr;:;"r“s
1.2.11 | 15T Abate Notice/Order 8 456 509
1.1.12 | 1* inspection with 1% Citation (weeds & grasses) 18 375 225
1.2.13 | 2" Inspection with 1% Citation 3 23 77
1.2.14 | 3" Inspection with 2" Citation 1 16 9
1.2.15 | Final Inspection with 3™ Citation 1 5 7
1.2.16 | May 2025 Compliant Inspections 23 174 795
1.2.17 | AB38 Inspections 62 422 325
1.2.18 | AB38 Re-inspection 11 103 53

2. COMMUNITY RELATION

2.1

2.2

23

24

2.5

2.6

2.7

2.8

2.9

2.10

September 5 & 27 — Fire Personnel provided ambulance coverage for the Big Bear
High School football game.

September 5-7 Fire Personnel provided ambulance coverage for the Spartan Race
held at Bear Mountain.

September 11 — Fire Personnel attended 911 Ceremonies at Big Bear High School,
Baldwin Lane Elementary School, and North Shore Elementary School.

September 13 — A CPR class was held with 15 participants.

September 13 & 27 — The Mountain Rim Fire Safe Council and Patrice Duncan
held an Insurance Workshop at Station 283, Sugarloaf, for community members.

September 19 — Fire Personnel attended Talk Like a Pirate Day held at Meadow
Park.

September 22 — Big Bear Fire Safe Council held a community meeting at Station
281, EOC.

September 25 — A CPR class was held for 9 members of the American Legion Post
#584.

September 28 — Fire Personnel attended the Boy Scouts Flag Burning Ceremony.

September 30 — Fire Personnel attended Family Fun Night at Big Bear High School.



September 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 3

3. OPERATIONS

3.1

3.2

33

3.4

Chief Wagner, and/or Director of Business Services Mandolini attended the
following meetings during the reporting month:

e Big Bear Fire Authority Regular Board meeting — September 9
e Fire Explorer Program Review — September 18

Battalion Chief Parham attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e Healthcare Preparedness Planning Partnership Coalition meeting — September
3

e CQILT — September 8
e EMS Officers meeting — September 10
e Image Trend Data Working Group — September 10

Battalion Chief Rogers attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e Big Bear City Community Services District Regular Board meeting —
September 15

Battalion Chief Fonda attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e San Bernardino County Training Officers Association (SBCTOA) Meeting —
September 11

e Stakeholder Tour of BVES Facilities and PSPS and System Briefing-
September 25 & 29

e Safety Committee meeting — September 25

4 HEALTH AND SAFETY

4.1

4.2

43

4.4

September 1 — Training was held for B Shift.
September 5 &, 16 — Multi Company Evolution training was held for A and C Shift.
September 8 — EMS Training was held for B Shift.

September 7, 14, 21, 28 — SCBA Sunday training was held.

5 ADVERTISING, PRESS RELEASES AND SOCIAL MEDIA

5.1

September — The following advertisements were placed:
e “Ambulance Membership” KBHR
o “Let’s Get Something Clear” Big Bear Now



September 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 4

5.2

September — The following social media posts were placed:
e 9/4/25 Ordinance 4907.3 Requirements
e 9/6/25 Brush Engine 281 on Local Wildfire
e 9/9/25 BC Fonda on Assignment
9/11/25 September 11 Never Forget
9/12/25 Firefighter Lutcavish Promotion
9/19/25 Explorers Program Relaunch
9/23/25 Defensible Space — Home Hardening
9/26/25 Free Sandbag

6 PERSONNEL

6.1

6.2

September 3 — Chief Wagner met C shift at each station to discuss on going
department operations.

September 15, 17 — An Engineer written exam and skills test was held.

7 ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF TRAINING/ CONFERENCES/ SEMINARS

7.1

7.2

September 2 — Facilities and Systems Manager Dickerson attended a CONFIRE
Communications and Support Committee meeting.

September 3, 17 - Facilities and Systems Manager Dickerson attended a
Cybersecurity and Infrastructure Security Agency (CISA) meeting.

8 STRIKE TEAMS & DUTY COVERAGE FOR FIRE RESPONSE

8.1

8.2

8.3

8.4

8.5

8.6

8.7

September 1-9 — Battalion Chief Fonda was assigned to the Pickett Incident in
Napa, CA

September 1-12 — Firefighter/Paramedic Dmytriw was assigned as a Fire Line
Paramedic on the Garnet Incident in the Sierra National Forest.

September 6-23 — Paid Call Captain Morelock was on overhead assignment on the
Garnet Incident in the Sierra National Forest.

September 7-15 — Battalion Chief Parham was assigned to the Garnet Incident in
the Sierra National Forest.

September 8-25 — Paid Call Division Chief Walker, Paid Call Division Chief Klar,
Paid Call Division Chief Towns, and Paid Call Battalion Chief Fisher were on
overhead assignment on the Dillon Incident in the Six Rivers National Forest

September 11-20 — Paid Call Technical Specialist Hutchinson was on overhead
assignment on the Garnet Incident in the Sierra National Forest.

September 26-30 — Firefighter/Paramedic Winfield was assigned as a Fire Line
Paramedic on the Garnett Incident in the Sierra National Forest.



September 2025 Monthly Activity Report
Page 5

9 CORRESPONDENCE

None



Aerial Ladder
Emergency Ops
Fire Pump

Fire Suppression
Forcible Entry

Hose

Hydrants/Streets, Water Supply
Ladders

Physical Fitness

Preventative Maintenance

SCBA

Technical Rescue

TOTAL COMPANY TRAINING
DOCUMENTATION HOURS

MISCELLANEOUS
ACLS and BLS Renewal
MCI Training

Traumatic Injuries

Ambulance Checkout

Basic Trauma Assessment
Chain Usage Policy

TRAINING SUMMARY REPORT
09/01/2025 - 09/30/2025

COMPANY TRAINING DOCUMENTATION HOURS

8

22

19.5

10.5

35.5

10

14

13.5

146

HOURS

FLEET PROGRAM

Fleet Program Accidents & Emergencies for
Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Adjusting to Changing Conditions
for Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Distracted Driving for Emergency
Vehicle Operators - EMS

Fleet Program Driver Safety Orientation for
Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Emergency Vehicle Characteristics
Fleet Program Impaired Driving for Emergency
Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Intersection Safety for Emergency
Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Legal Considerations for
Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Safe Backing for Emergency
Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Seat Belt & Airbag Safety for
Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Securing Materials for
Transportation for Emergency Vehicle Operators

Fleet Program Vehicle Inspection and
Maintenance for Emergency Vehicle Operators
Fleet Program Vehicle Safety and Security for
Emergency Vehicle Operators

FLEET PROGRAM HOURS

EMS

EMS Amputation Injuries (67651)

EMS Assessing the Patient with Major Trauma
(50121)

EMS Asthma Advanced (74334)

EMS Capnography (55027)

Page 1 of 2

HOURS

0.5

31.5

HOURS



TRAINING SUMMARY REPORT
09/01/2025 - 09/30/2025

MISCELLANEOUS CONTINUED

Customer Service for Fire Department Personnel
Driver Training Documentation

Facility Training Documentation

Hypothermia Training

Magnesium Training

NFPA 1500 Driving Safety

NFPA 470 Advanced HAZWOPER Awareness
(MOD #1)

NFPA 470: HAZMAT Operations Level
Refresher: Chemical Properties (MOD #2)
NFPA 470: HAZMAT Operations Level
Refresher: Recognition and Response (MOD #1)
NFPA 470: HAZMAT Operations Level
Refresher: Roles and Responsibilities (MOD #3)
Slishman Traction Splint

Winter Driving

TOTAL MISCELLANEOUS HOURS

TOTAL TRAINING HOURS

HOURS
1
117.75
76.5
1

1
3
2

268.25

536.75

EMS CONTINUED

EMS Carbon Monoxide Poisoning (51514)

EMS Clinical Decision-Making (66413)

EMS Communication and Documentation (1914)
EMS Health and Wellness (2498935)

EMS Heat Illness and Emergencies (40850)

EMS Hematology (60857)

EMS Managing Cardiac Arrest: During and After
Resuscitation (37691)

EMS Managing Chronic Care Patients (75612)
EMS Mechanics of Breathing (55873)

EMS Medical, Ethical, and Legal Issues (1589)

EMS Medication Errors (77246)

EMS Non-Traumatic Abdominal Injuries (1730)
EMS Non-Traumatic Chest Pain (33686)

EMS Operating an AED (4892)

EMS Patient Abuse and Assault (15982)

EMS Patients with Special Challenges (1927)
EMS Pediatric Assessment (30611)

EMS Protecting Yourself from Influenza (1870)
EMS Rapid Secondary Assessment (38979)
EMS Respiratory System A&P Review (1584)
EMS Safe Transportation of the Pediatric Patient
(2764200)

EMS Spinal Cord Injuries (72809)

EMS Supplemental Oxygen (38961)

EMS Training Documentation

EMS Workplace Stress (1475)

TOTAL EMS HOURS

Page 2 of 2

HOURS

—_ [ N NG Y] (U N

— NN NN~ ke e e e

\= 9]
—



Incident Type Report 9/1/25 - 9/30/25

1 Fi Count Est. Prop. Total Est.
e oun Loss Est. Content Loss Loss %
100 - Fire, other 1
111 - Building fire 1
113 - Cooking fire, confined to container 1 0 500 500 33.33%
131 - Passenger vehicle fire 1 1,000 0 1,000 66.67%
141 - Forest, woods or wildland fire 1
154 - Dumpster or other outside trash receptacle 1
fire
Incident Count 6 $1,000 $500 $1,500 100%
3 Rfascue & Emergency Medical Service Count 5 Service Call Count
Incident
320 - Emergency medical service, other 1 500 - Service call, other 1
‘32.1 - EMS call, excluding vehicle accident with 531 - Smoke or odor removal 1
njury 151
322 - Motor vehicle accident with injuries 2 550 - Public service assistance, other 10
323 - Motor vehicle/pedestrian accident (MV Ped) 1 553 - Public service 6
350 - Extrication, rescue, other 1 554 - Assist invalid 1
Interfacility Transfers (IFT's) 50 561 - Unauthorized burning 4
Incident Count 206 Incident Count 23
6 Good Intent Call Count
4 Hazardous Condition Count 611 - Dispatched and cancelled en route 13
611A - Alarm: Dispatched lled
412 - Gas leak (natural gas or LPG) 4 arm: Dispatched & Cancelle 2
Enroute
424 - Carbon monoxide incident 2 611E - EMS: Dispatched & Cancelled 16
Enroute
11G - Fire: Dispatch 11
440 - Electrical wiring/equipment problem, other 3 611G - Veg Fire: Dispatched & Cancelled 1
Enroute
11T - T/C: Dispatch 11
445 - Arcing, shorted electrical equipment 1 6 /C: Dispatched & Cancelled 2
Enroute
671 - HazMat rel i tigati
Incident Count 10 7 azMat release investigation w/no 1
HazMat
Incident Count 35

Page 1 of 2



Incident Type Report 9/1/25 - 9/30/25

7 False Alarm & False Call Count 9 Specil Incident Type
700 - False alarm or false call, other 4 200 = gl 7 e imeilent, elis:
733 - Smoke detector activation due to .
. 2 Incident Count
malfunction
735 - Alarm system sounded due to malfunction 2
743 - Smoke detector activation, no fire - g
unintentional
46 - . P
Z: O6 Carbon monoxide detector activation, no ) TOTAL INCIDENT COUNT

Incident Count 21

Count

302

Page 2 of 2



SEPTEMBER 2025 INCIDENTS BY TYPE

Other
Good Intent False oAIarm 0%
11% 6% \
Service Call

7%

EMS
47%

Hazardous Condition
3%

HeIicopter/

9%

IFTs/

15%



2025 YTD TOTAL INCIDENTS BY TYPE

Service Call Good Intent  F5ise Alarm Other
6% 10% 59% 0%
Hazardous | /////—
Condition
2%

EMS
55%

Helicopter
8%

IFTs
13%



DATE: December 9, 2025

TO: Board Chair and Directors of Big Bear Fire Authority

FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief M,}

PREPARED BY:  Chardelle Smith, Board Secretary Ofﬁ

SUBJECT: OCTOBER 2025 FIRE DEPARTMENT MONTHLY ACTIVITY

INTEROFFICE MEMO

Item No. FA3b

Big Bear Fire Authority

REPORT

1. SERVICE DELIVERY

Y ear-to-date incidents by call type percentages (see attached report)

1.1 Call types by month and year-to-date:

Current Calendar | Previous
Month YTD Year
1.2.1 | Fire Calls, Hazardous Conditions, Service Calls 86 935 1,338
1.2.2 | Rescue/Medical Calls 203 2,611 3,114
1.2.3 | Medical Flight Missions 41 499 375
1.2.4 | Training Class Summary (hours) 462.50 7,631.53 8,418.2
FIRE PREVENTION
1.2.5 | Plan Review 8 93 152
1.2.6 | Chipping Requests (2020 Suspended) -- - --
1.2.7 | Trees Removed/Reimbursed Through Grant 0 0 2
1.2.8 | Hazardous Tree Removal Notice to Proceed 0 0 3
12.9 Hazardous Tree 2"! & Final Abate Notice/Order B B i
(included in 1.2.11 and below)
1.2.10 | Tree Abatement Issues Resolved 4 17 5




October 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 2
FIRE PREVENTION CONTINUED Cl\‘l‘gfl‘:‘ﬁt Ca‘l{eT“Sar Pr;:;"r“s
1.2.11 | 15T Abate Notice/Order 3 459 509
1.1.12 | 1* inspection with 1% Citation (weeds & grasses) 7 382 225
1.2.13 | 2" Inspection with 1% Citation 10 33 77
1.2.14 | 3" Inspection with 2" Citation 1 16 9
1.2.15 | Final Inspection with 3™ Citation 4 9 7
1.2.16 | September 2025 Compliant Inspections 78 252 795
1.2.17 | AB38 Inspections 50 472 325
1.2.18 | AB38 Re-inspection 5 108 53

2. COMMUNITY RELATION

2.1

2.2

23

24

2.5

2.6

2.7

October 1 — Fire Personnel attended the Career Fair at Big Bear High School.

October 11 & 12 Fire Personnel provided ambulance coverage for the Kodiak Ultra

Marathon.

October 11 — In honor of Fire Prevention week, Big Bear Fire hosted a Chili Cook

off at Station 282.

October 18, 23, 24, 29 — Fire personnel provided ambulance coverage for the Big

Bear High School football game.

October 23 — Fire personnel attended the Baldwin Lane Elementary School trunk

or Treat.

October 30 — Fire Personnel attended the North Shore Elementary School Costume

Contest.

October 31 — Fire personnel attended Halloween in the Village.

3. OPERATIONS

3.1

Chief Wagner, and/or Director of Business Services Mandolini attended the

following meetings during the reporting month:

e San Bernardino County Chiefs Fire Chiefs Association meeting — October 23




October 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 3

3.2

33

34

Battalion Chief Parham attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e (al Chiefs EMS Section South meeting — October 16
e ImageTrend Update check in meeting — October 30

Battalion Chief Rogers attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e Incident Qualification Systems (IQS) meeting — October 10

e  Fire Marshal meeting — October 15

e Big Bear Fire Safe Council meeting — October 23

e National Emergency Response Information System (NERIS) Inland Counties
Emergency Medical Agency (ICEMA) meeting — October 29

e  State of the City — October 29

Battalion Chief Fonda attended the following meetings/trainings during the
reporting month:

e Big Bear Uniform meeting — October 6

e San Bernardino County Training Officers Association (SBCTOA) Meeting —
October 9

e San Bernardino County Fire Agencies Cooperators (XBO) monthly meeting —
October 16

e Vector Solutions meeting — October 17

4 HEALTH AND SAFETY

4.1

4.2

4.3

4.4

4.5

October 8 - Chief Wagner and Battalion Chief Parham attended the Annual Winter
Mountain Agencies meeting in Running Springs.

October 9 — Department Mechanic Hoss performed Tower 281 ladder service.
October 20, 21, 23 — Hose testing was held for all shifts.
October 26, 27, 29 — Multi Company Evolution training was held for all shifts.

October 5, 12, 19, 26 — SCBA Sunday training was held.

5 ADVERTISING, PRESS RELEASES AND SOCIAL MEDIA

5.1

52

October — The following advertisements were placed:
e “Ambulance Membership” KBHR
e “Let’s Get Something Clear” Big Bear Now

October — The following social media posts were placed:
e 10/1/25 Upcoming CPR AED Training Class



October 2025 Monthly Activity Report

Page 4

6 PERSONNEL

10/3/25 Family Fun Night recap

10/4/25 Upcoming Snowvember Event

10/5/25 Fire Prevention Week Kickoff - Chili Cook Off Event

10/6/25 Recycle Lithium-Ion Batteries Responsibly

10/7/25 Lithium-Ion Battery Safety Tips

10/8/25 Charging Lithium-Ion Batteries Safety Tips

10/9/25 Chimney Sweep Reminder

10/12/25 Chili Cook Off Winners

10/15/25 Repost — Free Chipping through Mountain Rim Fire Safe Council
10/16/25 Now Hiring — Ambulance Operator/Paramedic

10/21/25 Big Bear Firefighters Wear Pink to honor Breast Cancer
Awareness month

10/23/25 Shift Change Structure Fire Call
10/29/25 Repost — Caltrans SR-38 construction update

6.1 October 7, 16, 17 — A Captains Sim Lab was held for all company officers and
acting officers.

6.2  October 28-30 — Chief Wagner and Battalion Chief Fonda attended the 2025 Cal
Chiefs Annual Conference in Anaheim.

7 ADMINISTRATIVE STAFF TRAINING/ CONFERENCES/ SEMINARS

7.1 October 1 & 15 - Facilities and Systems Manager Dickerson attended a
Cybersecurity and Infrastructure Security Agency (CISA) meeting.

7.2 October 21 — Facilities and Systems Manager Dickerson attended an Underworld:
Inside the Ransomware Economy and How to Fight Back training

7.3 October 29 — Accounting Technician Eccles attended Udemy Grant Writing for
Beginners course.

8 STRIKE TEAMS & DUTY COVERAGE FOR FIRE RESPONSE

None

9 CORRESPONDENCE

None



BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
AGENDA REPORT

Item No. FA4
MEETING DATE:  December 9, 2025
TO: Board Chair and Directors of Big Bear Fire Authority
FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief %/
SUBJECT: ADOPTION OF THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA

FIRE CODE AND THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, ALONG WITH CERTAIN CHANGES,
MODIFICATIONS, AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS,
AND EXCEPTIONS, ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001

BACKGROUND

On November 5, 2025, the Big Bear Fire Authority Board conducted the first reading and
introduction of the ordinance to adopt the 2025 California Fire Code with local amendments.
During that meeting, the first reading was waived, and it was moved that the ordinance be
scheduled for a public hearing and second reading at the Fire Authority meeting of December 9,
2025.

In accordance with Government Code section 6066, notice of the public hearing must be
published once a week for two consecutive weeks, with at least five days in between each
publication. The first notice must be published at least fourteen days before the hearing date.
These requirements have been met with the Notice of hearing having been published on
November 13, 2025, and November 20, 2025.

After the public hearing and second reading, the Authority Board may adopt the ordinance. After
the ordinance has been adopted by the Fire Authority, it will be brought back to the San
Bernardino County Fire Protection District Board of Directors and the Big Bear Lake City
Council for ratification. Once ratified by each respective jurisdiction the ordinance will take
effect.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends the Fire Authority Board conduct a public hearing, and waiving the second
reading of, and adopt attached Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001, entitled:




Agenda Report — December 9, 2025

Adoption of Ordinance BBFA2025-001 Adopting the 2025 Edition of the California Fire Code
with Local Amendments

Page 2

ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE BIG BEAR
FIRE AUTHORITY, A CALIFORNIA JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY,
ADOPTING THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, THE
2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE
CODE, AND THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE, ALONG WITH CERTAIN CHANGES, MODIFICATIONS,
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS THERETO

And direct the Fire Chief to present the adopted ordinance to the San Bernardino County Fire
Protection District Board of Directors and the City of Big Bear Lake City Council for
ratification; and direct Interim Board Secretary, upon ratification, to file the findings with the
applicable governing agency.

Attachment: ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001 — 2025 FIRE CODE



ATTACHMENT A

ORDINANCE NO. BBFA2025-001

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
THE BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY, A CALIFORNIA
JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY, ADOPTING THE 2025
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, THE 2025
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA WILDLAND-URBAN
INTERFACE CODE, AND THE 2025 EDITION OF THE
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, ALONG WITH
CERTAIN CHANGES, MODIFICATIONS,
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND
EXCEPTIONS THERETO

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq. and California Health
and Safety Code Section 13869 et seq., the Big Bear Fire Authority (“Authority”’) may adopt by
reference the 2025 Edition of the California Fire Code, 2025 Edition of the Wildland-Urban
Interface Code, and the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code related to hazardous
conditions and materials and fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 13145 authorizes the Authority to enforce
building standards relating to fire and panic safety; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5, 17958.7, 18941.5, and 13869.7
permit the Authority to make such changes or modifications to the 2025 Edition Fire Code, the
2025 Edition Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and the 2025 Edition of the Residential Code as are
reasonably necessary upon express findings that such changes or modifications are needed due to
local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors of the Authority does herewith find that the Authority
service area has certain climatic, geological, and topographical features, identified below, that can
have a deleterious effect on emergency services such as fire protection and emergency medical
services and the modifications and changes herein are reasonably necessary because of such local
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the Authority desires to adopt various amendments to the 2025 Edition of the
California Fire Code, 2025 Edition Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and the 2025 Edition of the
California Residential Code to mitigate, to the extent possible, said deleterious effects; and

WHEREAS, the Authority held a public hearing on December 9, 2025, at which time, all
interested persons had the opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of adopting the Fire
Code, Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and Residential Code as amended herein; and

WHEREAS, the Authority published notice of the aforementioned public hearing pursuant
to California Government Code Section 6066 on November 13, 2025 and November 20, 2025; and

WHEREAS, any and all other legal prerequisites relating to the adoption of this ordinance
have occurred.

NOW, THEREFORE, be it ordained by the Board of Directors of the Authority as
follows:



Page 2
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

The following findings are adopted in reference to the amendments to the 2025 Edition of the
California Fire Code, 2025 Edition Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and the 2025 Edition of the
California Residential Code:

1.

Findings and Adoption of the California Fire Code, California Wildland-Urban Interface
Code, and California Residential Code. The Board of Directors of the Authority hereby finds
and determines:

(a) That the California Fire Code, 2025 Edition, 2025 Edition Wildland-Urban Interface
Code, and the California Residential Code, 2025 Edition, are Part 9, Part 7, and Part 2.5,
respectively, of the California Building Standards Code, located in Title 24 of the California
Code of Regulations, as published by the California Building Standards Commission. The
California Building Standards Code contains building standards which are state regulations
developed or adopted by various state agencies for specific types of buildings, building
equipment and features. New editions of the California Building Standards Code are
published every three years in a triennial cycle.

(b) That Health and Safety Code Section 13869 et seq. provides, in pertinent part, that a fire
protection district may adopt building standards relating to fire and panic safety that are more
stringent than those building standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the
California Building Standards Code as it determines are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions.

(c) That the additional requirements and standards established herein are needed to properly
protect the health, safety, and welfare of the existing and future residents and workers of the
Authority. Said requirements and standards are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions described herein. This finding is based
upon the express findings and determinations of the proposed amendments to the codes in this
ordinance.

(d) To the extent that the changes to state law implemented by Assembly Bill 130, which limit
city and county modifications to residential building standards, apply to the Authority, the
additional requirements and standards established herein are substantially equivalent to prior
changes and modifications previously adopted and filed by the Authority prior to September
30, 2025, and furthermore such changes or modifications relate to home hardening, and are
proposed by a fire prevention district pursuant to Health & Safety Code section 13869.7 (the
Authority operates pursuant to the Fire Protection District Law of 1987).

Findings for Amendments. The Board of Directors of the Authority finds that the
requirements set forth here are reasonable and necessary modifications because of the
following climatic, geological, or topographical conditions within the County of San
Bernardino (“County”) and the City of Big Bear Lake (“City”).

(a) Climate:

The jurisdiction is subject to weather patterns such as frequent periods of drought and low
humidity which add to the fire danger. During winter months heavy snow and ice
conditions exist resulting in increased demand for fire services and limiting or delaying
emergency vehicle access.



Page 3

Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

(b) High Temperature and Winds:

(c)

During the summer months, the dry winds and existing vegetation mix to create a
hazardous fuel condition, which has resulted in large-loss vegetation and structure fires.
Summer temperatures exceeding 95 degrees and severe “Santa Ana” winds frequently
occur and can move a fire quickly throughout areas of the County and City.

Limited Water Supply:

Because some areas within the County and City lack water supply by any public entity and
because of local weather patterns, the County and City (like other Southern California
regions) have, at times, experienced a need for water conservation. Due to consumption
and periods of limited rainfall, future water allocation may not be fully dependable during
periods of extended drought.

(d) Topographical:

(e)

®

Natural slopes of eight percent or greater generally occur throughout the mountain areas of
San Bernardino County. In many cases, slopes in the San Bernardino Mountains exceed
forty percent. The elevation change caused by the mountains and foothills creates the
geological foundation on which communities within San Bernardino County are built and
will continue to be built. With much of the populated flatlands already built upon, future
growth will occur on steeper slopes and greater contrasts in terrain. All of these
topographical conditions have created slower response times of emergency vehicles into
the high growth areas, due to the extraordinary terrain changes.

Geological Concerns with Flooding and Access Routes:

Road circulation features located throughout the County and City also make the
amendments reasonably necessary. Located through the County and City are major
roadways, highways, flood control channels and natural drainages that create barriers and
slow response times. Another unique factor, which creates barriers and slow response
times, are the multiple canyons located in the County and City. Hills, slopes, street, and
storm drain design, accompanied with heavy rainfall causes roadway flooding and
landslides and at times, may make an access route impassable. There exist areas in the
County and City that naturally have extended emergency response time that exceeds ten
minutes. This time extension is due to remote sparse development.

Seismic Hazards:

The County and City have within their boundaries potentially active seismic hazards.
Seismic activity within the County and City occurs yearly, and a fire potential exists with
these active faults. Existing structures and planned new development are at serious risk
from these faults.

(g) Dense Development:

Highly populated areas exist within the County and City. Structures in close proximity to
each other pose an exposure problem, which may cause a fire to spread from one structure
to another.



Page 4
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

(h) Administrative:

The amendment is necessary for non-substantive, administrative purposes.

The findings above are applicable to the amendments set forth in this ordinance as follows:

Code Section | Description Finding
FIRE CODE
101.1 Title (amended) h
103.2 Fire Code Official Appointment (deleted) h
104.10 Fire Investigations (amended) h
104.11.4 Authority as Peace Officers (added) h
104.12 Cost Recovery (added) h
104.13 Expenses for Securing an Emergency h
(added)
105.5.5 Carnivals, Fairs, Block Parties, and other a,b,c,d,
Outdoor Assemblage (amended) e,f, g
105.5.36 Exception: Recreational Fires (deleted) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
105.5.40 Outdoor Assemblies (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f. g
105.5.54 Wood Products (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f. g
105.5.60 Christmas tree sales (added) a,b,c,d,
e,f. g
112.1 Hearing Officer and Appeals Board h
Established (amended)
112.2 Limitations on Authority (amended) h
112.3 Qualifications (deleted) h
112.4 Administration (amended) h
112.5-112.9 Regarding Hearings (added) h
113.4 Violation Penalties (added) h




Page 5

Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

113.4.1 Abatement (amended) h
202 Definitions (amended) h
305.3 Open-Flame Warning Device (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
305.6 Spark Arrestors (added) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
307.1 -307.2 Regarding Open Fires (amended) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
307.3 Extinguishment Authority (amended) h
307.4-307.5 Regarding Recreational Fires (deleted) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
315.8 Outside Storage of Firewood (added) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
403.11.1 Fire Watch Personnel (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
503.2.1 Dimensions (amended) c,d,e g
503.2.3 Surface (amended) c,d,e g
503.4 Obstruction to Fire Apparatus Access c,d,e, g
Roads (amended)
507.1 Required Water Supply (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
507.3 Fire Flow (amended) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
507.3.1 Inadequate Fire Flow (added) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
903.2.11.7 Buildings 5,000 Square Feet or More in a,b,c,d,
Size (added) e, f, g
903.2.11.8 Additions to Existing Buildings (added) a,b,c,d,
e,f, g
903.7 Freeze Protection (added) a
5601.1.3 Fireworks (amended) a,b,c,d,

e, f, g




Page 6

Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

5601.1.3.1 Seizure (added) h
5704.4.9 Tank Storage Prohibited (added) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
Chapter 80 Stored Water (amended) a,b,c,d,
NFPA 13D e, f, g
6.2.2
Appendix B, Buildings Other than One- and Two-Unit a,b,c,d,
B105.2 Family Dwellings (amended) e, f, g
Appendix C, Fire Hydrants — Maximum Spacing a,b,c,d,
C103.1 (amended) e, f, g
Appendix C, Fire Hydrants — Availability (added) a,b,c,d,
C103.4 e, f, g
Appendix C, Fire Hydrants Table (deleted) a,b,c,d,
C102.1 e, f, g
Appendix R Wood Shake Shingle Roofs (added) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE
4014 Additional Requirements (added) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
604.1-604.2.1 Vegetation Management (amended) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
604.6.1 Defensible Space Requirements (added) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
604.6.2.1- Native Brush, Shrubs and Other Highly a,b,c,d,
604.6.2.7 Flammable Vegetation (added) e, f, g
RESIDENTIAL CODE
R309.3.1.2 Required Sprinkler Locations (amended) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g
R309.3.5.2 Required Capacity (amended) a,b,c,d,
e, f, g

3. Adoption of the California Fire Code. The Board of Directors of the Authority hereby adopts
with certain amendments, additions, deletions, and exceptions, including penalties in the 2025
Edition of the California Fire Code, also known as Part 9 of Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations (incorporating the 2024 International Fire Code), and Chapter 1, Appendix




Page 7
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

Chapter 4, and Appendices B, BB, C, CC, D, H, 1], & P and Errata, as compiled and published
by the International Code Council, and the Authority standards and interpretations as approved
by the fire code official. The provisions of this California Fire Code, subsequent amendments,
California Fire Code Appendices, and the Authority standards and interpretations shall be
collectively known as the “Authority Fire Code” and shall be applicable in all areas of the
Authority within the County and City. One (1) copy of the California Fire Code has been
deposited in the office of the Secretary of the Board of Directors of the Authority and shall be
at all times maintained by the Secretary for use and examination by the public. From the date
on which this ordinance shall take effect, the provisions hereof shall be controlling within the
limits of the Authority.

4. Adoption of the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code. The Board of Directors of the
Authority hereby adopts the 2025 Edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code,
also known as Part 7 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations (incorporating the 2024
International Wildland-Urban Interface Code), as compiled and published by the International
Code Council, and the Authority standards and interpretations as approved by the fire code
official. The provisions of this California Wildland-Urban Interface Code, subsequent
amendments, California Wildland-Urban Interface Code Appendices, and the Authority
standards and interpretations shall be applicable in all areas of the Authority.

5. Adoption of the California Residential Code. The Board of Directors of the Authority
hereby adopts the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code, also known as Part 2.5 of
Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations (incorporating the 2024 International
Residential Code), as compiled and published by the International Code Council, and the
Authority standards and interpretations as approved by the fire code official. The provisions
of this California Residential Code, subsequent amendments, California Residential Code
Appendices, and the Authority standards and interpretations shall be applicable in all areas of
the Authority.

6. Amendments to the California Fire Code. The California Fire Code is amended as follows:

(a) Chapter 1

Section 101.1 is amended to read:

101.1 Title. These regulations and adopted standards and interpretations, as approved by
the fire code official and Big Bear Fire Authority, shall be known as the “Fire Code of the Big
Bear Fire Authority,” hereinafter referred to as, “Big Bear Fire Authority Fire Code,” or “this
code.”

Section 103.2 is deleted.

Section 104.10 is amended to read:

104.10- Fire Investigations. The Big Bear Fire Authority (“fire department” or
“department”) shall have the authority to investigate the cause, origin, and circumstances of any
fire, explosion, release of hazardous materials or other hazardous condition. The fire chief or fire
code official shall be responsible to pursue any investigation to its conclusion. Information that
could be related to trade secrets or processes shall not be made part of the public record except as
directed by a court of law.



Page 8
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

Section 104.11.4 is added to read:

104.11.4 Authority as Peace Officers. The Fire Chiefis authorized to designate a member,
or members, of the department as peace officers pursuant to California Penal Code Sections
830.37(a)-(b) and 836.5(a). The Fire Chief, Fire Marshal and those members designated as
investigators by the Fire Chief, shall have the full powers of a peace officer and shall be authorized
to conduct investigative detentions, issue criminal citations, and make arrests pursuant to
California Penal Code Section 836 for any violation of this code or any referenced or state law,
obtain and execute warrants and to seize and take charge of all physical evidence relating to the
fire cause or other crime or circumstance being investigated.

Section 104.12 is added to read:

104.12 Cost Recovery. Fire suppression, investigation, plan review, administrative costs,
emergency abatement, nuisance false alarms, and rescue or emergency medical costs are
recoverable in accordance with Health and Safety Code Sections 13009 and 13009.1 and by
Authority ordinance or resolution.

Section 104.13 is added to read:

104.13 Expenses for Securing an Emergency. Any person who negligently or
intentionally, or in violation of law, causes an emergency response, including, but not limited to,
a traffic accident or spill of toxic or flammable or combustible liquids or chemicals, is liable for
the costs of securing such emergency, including those costs set out in Health and Safety Code
Section 13009 et seq. and Government Code Section 53150 et seq. Any expense incurred by the
fire department for securing such an emergency situation shall constitute a debt of such person and
shall be collectible by the Authority in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under
contract, express or implied.

Section 105.5.5 is amended to read:

105.5.5 Carnivals, Fairs, Block Parties, and Other Outdoor Assemblage. An
operational permit is required to conduct a carnival, fair, block party, race, concert, parade or
other similar outdoor assemblage whether, public or private, when in the opinion of the fire code
official, a permit and specific conditions are required due to the nature or location of the activity.

Section 105.5.36 is amended to read:

105.5.36 Open Burning. An operational permit is required for the kindling or
maintaining of an open fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or private ground.
Instructions and stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.

Delete Exception: Recreational fires.

Section 105.5.40 is amended to read:

105.5.40 Outdoor assembly event. An operational permit is required to conduct an
outdoor assembly, temporary use or other special event where planned attendance exceeds 300
persons per day.



Page 9
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

105.5.54 is amended to read:

105.5.54 Wood products. An operational permit is required for the operation of a firewood
processing facility and for the storage of wood chips, hogged material or plywood in excess of 200
cubic feet (6 m®).

105.5.60 is added to read:

105.5.60 Christmas tree sales. An operational permit is required for the operation of a
Christmas tree lot, stand or other site selling Christmas trees.

Section 112.1 is amended to read:

112.1 Hearing Officer and Appeals Board Established. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the
application and interpretation of this code, the Authority may contract with or otherwise designate
a hearing officer to consider appeals from an order, decision or determination by the fire code
official. Certain appeals involving enforcement by the County may also be heard by the County
Fire Protection District Fire Chief/Fire Warden, the Fire Chief’s/Fire Warden’s designee, or other
hearing officer so designated by the County and/or the County Fire Protection District in
accordance with their appeal procedures, including any subsequent review or appeals. In order to
hear and review a hearing officer’s decision (except those involving enforcement by the County),
a committee of the Big Bear Fire Authority Board of Directors shall serve as an Appeals Board.
The Appeals Board shall be comprised of the Chairman of the Authority Board of Directors and
four other members of the Board of Directors appointed by the Chairman. The hearing officer(s)
and Appeals Board may adopt additional rules of procedure for conducting their business.

Section 112.2 is amended to read:

112.2 Limitations on Authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that
the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted,
the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equivalent or better form of construction is
proposed. The hearing officer and Appeals Board shall not have authority to waive requirements
of this code or interpret the administration of this code.

Section 112.3 is deleted.

Section 112.4 is amended to read:

112.4 Administration. The fire code official shall take immediate action in accordance
with the decision of the hearing officer once such decision is final, or of a final decision of the
Appeals Board.

Sections 112.5 to 112.9 are added to read:

112.5 Requests for Appeal to a Hearing Officer. Any person desiring to appeal an order,
decision, or determination of the fire code official relative to the application and interpretation of
this code, may file a request with the Secretary of the Board of Directors or other person identified
in the order, decision, or determination for a hearing before a hearing officer within 15 days after



Page 10
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

the date such order, decision, or determination is rendered or enforcement began. An appeal
request shall be in writing, shall state the specific reasons for the appeal and the grounds asserted
for relief, and shall include with the request the hearing fee as further described below. The
enforcement to be reviewed is suspended until the determination of the hearing, unless a hazardous
condition exists. The failure to file an appeal within the time or in the manner prescribed in this
section, or to include the hearing fee, waives the right to appeal.

112.6 Hearing Procedures — Hearing Officer. Upon receipt of a request for a hearing
before a hearing officer, the Secretary of the Board of Directors or other person identified in the
order, decision, or determination shall refer the matter to the hearing officer, which shall hold a
hearing not less than 10 days nor more than 30 days after the date of the filing of the request for
hearing. The hearing officer shall give written notice of the time and place of the hearing to the
appellant and the fire code official involved at least 10 days prior to the hearing. Witnesses may
be sworn and evidence produced, and parties may be represented by counsel. The hearing officer
shall keep a record of the proceedings of each hearing and shall issue written findings and a
decision within 15 days after the conclusion of the hearing. All such decisions shall be mailed to
the parties by first class mail, postage prepaid, at such addresses as they have provided. The
hearing officer’s decision is final 15 days after service of the hearing officer's decision on the
appellant, unless Appeals Board review is timely requested either by the fire code official or
appellant.

112.7 Requests for Review by Appeals Board. To request Appeals Board review of a
hearing officer’s decision, the appellant or fire code official may file a request with the Secretary
of the Board of Directors for a hearing before the Appeals Board within 15 days after the date of
service of the hearing officer’s decision. A request for review shall be in writing, shall state in
detail the reasons for review and the error(s) alleged in the hearing officer’s decision, and shall
include with the request the hearing fee as further described below. The enforcement to be
reviewed is suspended until the determination of the hearing, unless a hazardous condition exists.
The failure to file a request for review within the time or in the manner prescribed in this section,
or to include the hearing fee, waives the right to seek review by the Appeals Board.

112.8 Hearing Procedures — Appeals Board. Upon receipt of a request for a hearing
before the Appeals Board, the Secretary of the Board of Directors shall refer the matter to the
Appeals Board, which shall hold a hearing not less than 10 days nor more than 45 days after the
date of the filing of the request for review. The Appeals Board shall give written notice of the
time and place of the hearing to the appellant and the fire code official involved at least 10 days
prior to the hearing. The parties may be represented by counsel and witnesses may be sworn and
evidence produced; provided, however, that the Appeals Board shall be authorized to deny the
introduction of supplementary evidence and decide the matter after oral argument, to admit
supplementary evidence with respect to challenges of particular findings, or reject the hearing
officer’s findings and conclusions and conduct a de novo hearing. The Appeals Board shall keep
a record of the proceedings of the hearing and shall issue written findings and a decision within 15
days after the conclusion of the hearing. All such decisions shall be mailed to the parties by first
class mail, postage prepaid, at such addresses as they have provided. The Appeals Board’s decision
is final 15 days after service the decision on the appellant.

112.9 Fees and Costs. A request for a hearing before either a hearing officer or the
Appeals Board shall require the Secretary’s receipt of payment of a hearing fee, which may be
determined and set by the fire department to cover the cost of preparing the record for the appeal
and for any other costs or expenses of conducting the hearing. Unless otherwise specified by



Page 11
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

resolution, the appeal fee is $250. After all appeals have been exhausted, the fire department will
refund any portion of the appeal fee(s) which are not used. A summary of the costs will be
compiled and sent to the appellant and paid within thirty (30) days of exhaustion of all appeals.

Section 113.4 is amended to read:

113.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail
to comply with any of the requirements of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used
under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not
more than $1,000 dollars and/or by imprisonment not exceeding 6 months, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense. (H&S Code Section 13145 and 17995).

Section 113.4.1is amended to read:

113.4.1 Abatement of violation. In addition to the imposition of penalties herein
described, the fire code official is authorized to institute appropriate action to prevent unlawful
construction or to restrain, correct or abate a violation or to prevent illegal occupancy of a structure
or premises; or to stop an illegal act, conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on or about
any premises. In the event that a hazardous condition exists, as determined by the fire code official
and in accordance with this chapter, the fire code official may give notice to the owner of the
property upon which a hazardous condition exists to abate such condition. In the event that
abatement is not performed within the time frames granted by such notices or other written
documentation, and or is deemed an immediate threat to public safety, the fire code official may
cause abatement to be done in accordance with public nuisance abatement procedures and make
the expense of such abatement a lien upon the property at which such condition exists.

(b) Chapter 2

Section 202 is amended by adding the following definitions:

All Weather Driving Surface. Unless otherwise defined within other Codes, Rules,
Standards or Regulations, the following are considered to be All Weather Driving Surfaces:

A. Three-inch (3”) Type II A.C. pavement on four inch (4”) crushed aggregate base.

B. Six-inch (6”) Type II A.C. pavement on native soil.

C. Six-inch (6”) Portland cement concrete pavement on native soil.

D. Any other surface as determined by the fire code official to meet the intent of this Code.

Barbecue Grill (also known as a barbeque or BBQ). A portable or fixed device,
constructed of steel, concrete, clay, or other non-combustible material, for the primary
purpose of cooking food over a liquefied petroleum-, natural gas-, or charcoal-fueled fire.

Barbecue Pit. A trench or depression in the ground in which wood or other clean solid
fuel is burned to produce a bed of hot coals for the sole purpose of cooking. A barbecue
pit having a fuel area greater than 3 feet in width or 2 feet in height shall be considered a
bonfire.



Page 12
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

Open Fires. Any outdoor fire, recreational fires and bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces,
barbecues, barbecue pits, and tiki torches wherein products of combustion are emitted
directly into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed
chamber. Fire emitted from weed-burning torches, hand-held torches, and flamethrowers
is also considered to be an open fire.

(c) Chapter 3

Section 305.3 is amended to read:

305.3 Open-flame Warning Devices. Open-flame warning devices shall not be used
along an excavation, road or any other place where the dislodgment of such device may permit
the device to roll, fall or slide onto any area or land containing combustible materials.

EXCEPTION: This section shall not apply to public safety personnel acting in the
performance of their duties.

Section 305.6 is added to read:

305.6 Spark arrestors. Each chimney used in conjunction with a fireplace, portable
outdoor fireplace, or other heating appliance in which solid fuel is burned, shall be maintained
with an approved spark arrester. The spark arrestor shall have heat and corrosion resistance
equivalent to 12-gauge wire, 19-gauge galvanized wire or 24-gauge stainless steel. Openings shall
not permit the passage of spheres having a diameter larger than one-half inch (13 mm) maximum
and shall not block the passage of spheres having a diameter of less than three-eighths inch (10
mm). The screen shall be mounted in or over all outside flue openings in a vertical or near vertical
position, adequately supported to prevent movement and shall be visible from the ground. All
spark arrestors shall be accessible and removable for cleaning.

Section 307.1 is amended to read:

307.1 General. A person shall not kindle, or maintain any fire, or allow any fire to be
kindled or maintained on their property unless in accordance with this Code.

Section 307.2 is amended to read:

307.2 Permit Required. When required pursuant to Section 105.6.32, a permit shall be
obtained prior to kindling any open fire.

EXCEPTION: Barbecues, portable outdoor fireplaces or fire rings using propane,
natural gas or charcoal briquettes.

Section 307.3 is amended to read:

307.3 Extinguishment Authority. The fire code official is authorized to order or cause
the extinguishment of any fire that creates or adds to a hazardous condition, creates smoke
emissions offensive to occupants of surrounding properties, is conducted without a permit when
such a permit is required, or is conducted outside of the parameters set forth in this section or a
permit, when required.



Page 13
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

Sections 307.4 through 307.5 are deleted.

Section 315.8 is added to read:

315.8 Outside Storage of Firewood. Firewood and combustible material stored and for
consumption on residential properties, shall be neatly stacked free from accumulations of pine
needles and other debris. Firewood stored against a structure shall be stored in a weather resistant
structure and or covered in a fire-resistant fabric.

(d) Chapter 4

Section 403.11.1 is amended to read:

403.11.1 Fire Watch Personnel. When, in the opinion of the fire code official, it is
essential for public safety in a place of assembly or any other place where people congregate,
because of the number of persons, or the nature of the performance, exhibition, display, contest or
activity, the fire code official may require, at the expense of the owner, agent or lessee, one or
more fire department personnel to perform fire watch duties, as required and to remain on duty
during the times such places are open to the public or when such activity is being conducted.

EXCEPTION: The fire code official may require the owner, agent or lessee to provide
one or more fire watch personnel.

(e) Chapter 5

Section 503.2.1 is amended to read:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not
less than 24 feet (7315.2 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet 6
inches (4450.08 mm).

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Driveways of one- and two-unit family dwellings shall be a minimum of 12 feet in
width.

2. Driveways of one- and two-unit family dwellings exceeding 150 feet in length shall be
a minimum of 14 feet in width.

3. Required access road dimensions may be modified when, due to location on property,
topography, waterways, nonnegotiable grades or other similar conditions, the fire code
official determines that the conditions cannot be met.

Section 503.2.3 is amended to read:

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and maintained to support
the imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to provide all weather driving
capabilities. Where road grades do not exceed eight percent (8%), and where serving only one-
or two- unit family dwellings or accessory Group U occupancies, the fire code official may



Page 14
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

approve roads constructed with approved native materials or gravel compacted to eighty five
percent (85%) compaction.

Section 503.4 is amended to read:

503.4 Obstruction of Fire Apparatus Access Roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall
not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and
clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall be maintained at all times. Any condition that
serves as an impediment to fire access, or any vehicle or other obstruction to fire access may be
removed at the order of the fire code official, with the expense of such removal to be paid by the
owner of the roadway, or of said vehicle or obstruction.

Section 507.1 is amended to read:

507.1 Required Water Supply. An approved water supply capable of supplying the
required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon which facilities, buildings
or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction.

EXCEPTION: For single one- and two-unit family dwellings and detached garages, not
part of a parcel map, tentative tract or other similar planned development, an approved automatic
residential fire sprinkler system or an approved self-contained residential automatic sprinkler
system may be considered as an adequate water supply with no additional on-site water source
required.

Section 507.3 is amended to read:

507.3 Fire Flow. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and
facilities shall be determined by an approved method or Appendix B.

EXCEPTION:

1. For single one- and two-unit family dwellings and detached garages, not part of a parcel
map, tentative tract or other similar planned development, the installation of an
approved automatic residential fire sprinkler system or an approved self-contained
residential automatic sprinkler system may be considered an approved fire flow.

2. No water supply or fire sprinkler system is required for detached Group U occupancies
not used for industrial or commercial properties when structures are located 50 feet or
farther from the property lines and any dwelling.

Section 507.3.1 is added to read:

507.3.1 Inadequate Fire Flow. In areas which are unable to be provided with required fire
flow, buildings shall be provided with an approved NFPA sprinkler system. On-site water storage
requirements for occupancies other than Group R, Division 3 may be reduced to a 30-minute
minimum sprinkler demand.



Page 15
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

(f) Chapter 9
Section 903.2.11.7 is added to read:

903.2.11.7 Building Fire Area 5,000 Square Feet or More in Size. An approved
automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout in all newly constructed buildings
and structures of any occupancy group when the gross fire area, as defined in the California
Building Code, is equal to or exceeds 5,000 square feet.

1. EXCEPTIONS: Detached Group U occupancies accessory to a one- or two-family
dwelling that are not used for commercial or industrial purposes.

Section 903.2.11.8 is added to read:

903.2.11.8 Additions to Existing Buildings. When an addition to an existing residential
structure results in a structure greater than 5,000 square feet and the addition is 50% or more of
the original square footage, the entire structure shall be provided with an automatic sprinkler
system.

Section 903.7 is added to read:

903.7  Freeze Protection. All sprinkler systems shall be suitably freeze-protected for
climatic conditions as prescribed by the fire code official.

EXCEPTION: New or used mobile homes or manufactured homes that are used or
intended for use as a dwelling, and new or used multifamily manufactured homes with two
dwelling units, are exempt pursuant to State law. (H&S Code § 18015; 25 CCR § 4300.)

(g) Chapter 56

Section 5601.1.3 is amended to read:

5601.1.3 Fireworks. The possession, manufacture, storage, sale, and use of fireworks is
prohibited.

Delete Exceptions: 1 - 4

Exception: A permit may be issued by the fire code official in accordance with Section
5608 for the use of fireworks or pyrotechnics for public fireworks display or special effects in
motion picture, television, theatrical productions.

Section 5601.1.3.1 is added to read:

5601.1.3.1 Seizure. The fire code official is authorized to remove or cause to be removed
or disposed of in an approved manner, at the expense of the owner, explosives, explosive materials
or fireworks offered or exposed for sale, stored, possessed or used in violation of this chapter.



Page 16
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

(h) Chapter 57
Section 5704.4.9 is added to read:

5704.4.9 Tank Storage Prohibited. Pursuant to this Section 5704, the storage of
flammable and combustible liquids in outside aboveground unprotected tanks and below grade
vaulted tanks shall be prohibited in areas where the fire code official determines that the
installation of flammable and combustible aboveground storage tanks or below grade vaulted tanks
will create a hazard to occupants and property owners in the area.

(i) Chapter 80
NFPA 13D is amended as follows:

Section 6.2.2 is amended to add subsection (2) to read as follows:

6.2.2(2) Where stored water is used as the sole source of supply for the sprinkler system,
the minimum quantity shall equal the water demand rate times 10 minutes.

(j) Appendix B

Section B105.2 of Appendix B is amended to read:

B105.2 Buildings Other than One- and Two-Unit Family Dwellings. The minimum
fire flow and flow duration for buildings other than one- and two-unit family dwellings shall be
as specified in Table B105.1.

EXCEPTION: A reduction in required fire flow of up to 50 percent, as approved, is
allowed when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. A reduction in required fire flow of up to 75
percent is allowed for isolated buildings of Group U occupancy, agricultural uses, or other low
hazard uses when approved by the fire code official. The resulting fire flow shall not be less than
1,500 gallons per minute (5678 L/min) for the prescribed duration as specified in Table B105.1.

(k) Appendix C
Section C103.4 is added to read:

C103.4 Fire Hydrants Available. The number of fire hydrants available to a complex or
subdivision shall not be less than that determined by spacing requirements specified in this
Appendix C when applied to fire apparatus access roads and perimeter public streets from which
fire operations could be conducted.

Section C103.1 is amended to read:

C103.1 Maximum Spacing. The average spacing between fire hydrants shall not exceed
300 feet (91m) in industrial, commercial, and multifamily development, and 600 feet (183m) in
all single-family developments. Spacing of fire hydrants along public streets shall also be guided
by other County or Authority public works standards.



Page 17
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

EXCEPTION: The fire code official is authorized to accept a deficiency of up to ten (10)
percent where existing fire hydrants provide all or a portion of the required fire hydrant fire flow.

Table C102.1 is deleted.

(1) Appendix -R is added to read:

R101 Findings.

A. The Authority Board finds and declares that wood shake shingle roofs are a severe fire
hazard and danger to the lives, health, property and safety of the residents residing in the
territory of the Authority and the surrounding communities.

B. The Authority Board finds and declares that wood shake shingle roofs are comprised of
materials that create a unique and significant fire hazard and danger to an extent that they
constitute a public nuisance, as set forth by Section 3480 of the California Civil Code, because
they are injurious to the health and safety of and substantially endanger the entire community.

C. The Authority Board finds and declares that the Authority’s enforcement and abatement of
all existing buildings or structures within the territory of the Authority located within the City
of Big Bear Lake with wood shake shingle roofs shall be consistent with the provisions set
forth in Chapter 8.81 “Wood Shake Shingle Roofs” of the City of Big Bear Lake Municipal
Code.

D. The Authority Board finds and declares that the Authority’s enforcement and abatement of
all existing buildings or structures within the territory of the Authority located within the
County of San Bernardino and not within the City of Big Bear Lake with wood shake shingle
roofs shall be consistent with the provisions set forth in Ordinance No. 4369 “An Ordinance
of the County of San Bernardino, State of California, Amending Section 23.0801 of the San
Bernardino County Code, Relating to Roof Coverings” of the County of San Bernardino
County Code.

E. Authority Ordinance No. BBFA2014-001 previously established similar provisions and
designated all wood shake shingle roofs on properties or structures within the territory of the
Authority to be a public nuisance.

R102 Wood Shake Shingle Roofs—Public Nuisance.

A. All wood shake shingle roofs on properties or structures within the territory of the
Authority located within the City of Big Bear Lake shall be abated as a public nuisance and a
dangerous building by the fire chief, or his or her designee in accordance with City of Big Bear
Lake Municipal Code Chapter 8.81.

B. All wood shake shingle roofs on properties or structures located within the territory of the
Authority located within the County of San Bernardino and not within the City of Big Bear
Lake shall be abated as a public nuisance and a dangerous building by the fire chief, or his or
her designee in accordance with Ordinance No. 4369 of the County of San Bernardino County
Code.



Page 18
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

7. Amendments to the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code. The California Wildland-
Urban Interface Code is amended as follows:

a. Chapter 4
Section 401.4 is added to read:

401.4 Additional Requirements. Dependent upon specific site conditions (e.g., building
separation, property line setbacks, fire flow, road conditions, slope, vegetation, etc.) or a
combination of conditions, the Authority may require structures to meet more stringent
construction standards (e.g, exterior walls to be constructed to the modified or full one-hour
construction standards, etc.) as additional mitigation to the fire threat.

b. Chapter 6

Section 604.1 is amended to read:

604.1 General. Hazardous vegetation and fuels shall be managed, at all times, to reduce
the severity of potential exterior wildfire exposure to buildings and to reduce the risk of fire
spreading to buildings in accordance with Section 603.

Section 604.2.1 is added to read:

604.2.1 Application. Those areas protected by the Big Bear Fire Authority shall
be classified as a Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone.

Section 604.6.1 is added to read:

604.6.1 Requirements. It shall be the responsibility of every property owner, occupant,
and person in control of any land interest to abate the accumulation of forest fuels around their
property, through implementation of the following measures within twenty ten (20 10) feet of
roads, streets, highways, driveways, and parking lots, and within (100) feet of all aspects of a
structure or to the property line (whichever is less), unless the Fire Code Official deems more area
is required for emergency ingress or egress.

a. Remove all dead, burnable fuels, including but not limited to all pine needles, leaves, pine
cones, and branches on roofs, on and under decking, noxious weeds or vegetation, dry
grass, logs, dead-dying trees, identified hazard trees, dead branches, limbs in trees and
shrubs, grass four inches and higher, pine needles on the ground down to a two-inch depth,
and all combustible rubbish, debris, or noxious material that constitutes a fire, health, or
safety hazard, or which may endanger or injure neighboring property, or the health, safety,
or well-being of persons or property.

b. Thin dense groups of trees (less than six inches in diameter) to six to eight-foot spacing,
measured trunk to trunk. Removal of any live tree with a diameter of more than six inches
measured at four and one-half feet above the ground requires approval by the city.

c. In areas with a continuous canopy, any tree taller than forty-five (45) feet shall have its
branches pruned back to the trunk if the limbs and branches have any portion lower than
twelve (12) to fifteen (15) feet from the ground. A tree shorter than forty-five (45) feet shall
be pruned to remove any live or dead limbs and branches up (6) feet or no more than 25%



Page 19
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

of total height. For non-continuous canopy areas, tree branches shall be pruned to remove
limbs located less than 6 feet above the ground surface.

Exception: Deciduous trees. Specimen and individual standing trees could/shall be
prescribed specific abatement requirements.

d. All native brush, shrubs and other highly flammable vegetation shall be installed and
maintained in a manner that minimizes fire risk, including, without limitation, by removing
dead branches and twigs at all heights, pruning the lower 25% foliage of branches, and
selectively pruning to reduce the density of the plant.

e. Native brush or other highly flammable vegetation shall be installed and maintained with
horizontal spacing such that the space between two shrubs (horizontally) shall be a
minimum of two times the height of the tallest shrub. Individual shrubs or groups of shrubs
clumped together shall be modified so that their diameter does not exceed fifteen (15) feet.
Groups of shrubs clumped together with a diameter of fifteen (15) feet or less shall be
treated as a single plant.

f.  Any limbs, branches that have any portions less than ten (10) feet from chimney opening
shall be completely removed. Limbs and branches located within ten (10) feet vertical and
horizontal distance from the roof line or overhang a structure shall be abated. Any tree
limbs and branches identified as a fire hazard within 5 feet of a structure shall be abated.

g. All litter generated from clearing and trimming shall be properly disposed of within ten
(10) days, except that any logs infested with bark beetles or GSOB shall be treated prior to
removal as recommended by the California Department of Forestry or a qualified tree
expert.

h. Firewood and combustible material stored and for consumption on residential property
shall be neatly stacked free from accumulations of pine needles and other
debris. Firewood shall be stored in a weather resistant structure and or covered in a fire
resistant fabric at all times. Firewood should be stacked away from the drip line of trees.

i.  All pine needles and leaves shall be removed from within five (5) feet of a structure.

Exception: Greater than 5 feet from a structure, up to two (2) inches of duff layer
(dark layer of decomposing needles and leaves) may remain to prevent soil
erosion and promote soil health.

Sections 604.6.2 is added to read:

604.6.2 Native Brush, Shrubs and Other Highly Flammable Vegetation.

604.6.2.1 Requirements for Shrubs on Properties. Native brush or other highly
flammable vegetation shall not be planted or maintained within fifteen (15) feet of any building or
structure, including, without limitation, any deck or patio and within twenty (20) feet of roads,
streets, highways, driveways, and parking lots. All owners of any real property shall be required
to fully comply with this provision by abating the offending native brush and shrub, which shall
be considered a nuisance.



Page 20
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

a. All native brush, shrubs and other highly flammable vegetation shall be installed and
maintained in a manner that minimizes fire risk, including, without limitation, by removing
dead branches and twigs at all heights, pruning the lower 25% of branches, and selectively
pruning to reduce the density of the plant.

b. Native brush or other highly flammable vegetation shall be installed and maintained with
horizontal spacing such that the space between two shrubs (horizontally) shall be a
minimum of two times the height of the tallest shrub. Individual shrubs or groups of shrubs
clumped together shall be modified so that their diameter does not exceed fifteen (15) feet.
Groups of shrubs clumped together with a diameter of fifteen (15) feet or less shall be
treated as a single plant.

c. Subsections B, C, and D of this Section shall not apply to an isolated shrub or shrubs that
have been heavily modified by thinning and pruning up, nor to activities within the
boundaries of a plant conservation easement area that do not, in the opinion of the fire
chief, or his or her designee, constitute a fire hazard. In deciding whether such shrub or
shrubs constitute a fire hazard, the fire chief, or his or her designee, shall consider: (i) the
proximity of the shrub(s) to other buildings or structures; (ii) the types of shrub(s) involved;
(ii1) the potential threat of the shrub(s) to the public health, welfare and safety; and (iv) any
other factors that the fire chief, or his or her designee, deem relevant when considering the
public health, safety and welfare, including, without limitation, whether such shrub(s) is
endangered, rare or threatened.

d. Cut and/or thinned vegetation shall be disposed of no later than ten (10) days after
cutting.

604.6.2.2 Definitions / Administration and Enforcement.

a. For the purposes of this Section, these following terms shall be defined as follows:

1. Modify or abate shall mean any action that physically affects a plant, ranging
from pruning or thinning to complete removal (other than the removal of the root
ball);

2. Native brush shall be defined as Manzanita (arctostaphylos patula), Service
Berry, Mountain Whitethorn, Sage and Mountain Mahogany (cercocarpus
ledifolius) (brush form) (commonly known in Big Bear Valley as Ironwood), as
well as such other species as the fire chief, or his or her designee, may, from time
to time, determine constitutes a fire hazard. In making such a determination, the
fire chief shall consider, without limitation, the following: (i) the type of native
brush and/or shrub species the fire chief, or his or her designee, is considering
adding to the definition of “native brush” and whether such species is threatened
or endangered; (i1) the fire, health or safety hazard of such native brush and/or
shrub species to the territory of the Authority and the surrounding community;
(111) the ability of the native brush and/or shrub species to damage neighboring
property; (iv) the ability of the native brush and/or shrub species to adversely
impact the health, safety or welfare of persons and/or property; and (v) any other
factors that the fire chief, or his or her designee, deem relevant when considering
the public health, safety and welfare;



Page 21
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

3. Highly Flammable Vegetation shall be defined as any ornamental shrub, tree
or plant, other than native brush, which is known to exhibit high flammability
due to its high oil or resin content and/or is prone to the production of large
amounts of dead leaves or other foliage within or under the plant. Examples of
highly flammable vegetation include, but are not limited to, ornamental juniper
species, ornamental cypress species, Spanish Broom, Scotch Broom and
rosemary;

4. “Owner” means any person, firm, corporation or entity, including without
limitation, any homeowner’s association that has any legal or equitable interest
in real property, as shown on public records. In the event real property is leased
or rented, the lessee or tenant shall be responsible for all obligations imposed on
any owner under this chapter;

5. “Shrubs” means a woody plant smaller than a tree, usually having multiple
permanent stems branching from or near the ground. Shrubs include, without
limitation, native brush;

6. “Vacant lot(s)” means a parcel(s) of property currently undeveloped or
unimproved by any building or structure.

b. The fire chief, or designee, shall enforce the provisions of this chapter with respect to any

and all properties as he or she deems necessary for the public health, safety and welfare.
In making such a determination, the fire chief, or his or her designee, shall consider: (i) the
proximity of the brush and/or shrubs to other buildings or structures; (ii) the types of brush
and/or shrubs involved; (iii) the potential threat of the brush and/or shrubs to the public
health, welfare and safety; (iv) the determination of any other public agencies as to the fire
danger of the area; and (v) any other factors that the fire chief, or his or her designee, deem
relevant when considering the public health, safety and welfare.
Any public official or person designated to administer or enforce this chapter shall be
authorized to enter upon private property in order to conduct an inspection, post notices,
perform abatement/modification, or any other action necessary or convenient to the
administration and enforcement of this chapter. In the event a judicial warrant is required,
such person or designee shall obtain a warrant pursuant to the California Code of Civil
Procedure, Sections 1822.50 et seq.

604.6.2.3 Environmental Exemptions. The modification of brush or shrubs, as described
in this Section, shall be exempt from the provisions of this chapter if any or all of the following
would occur:

a. The activities would result in the taking of endangered, rare, or threatened plant or animal
species. By way of example, and not by way of limitation, the following species of plant
are, as of the date of the ordinance adopting this chapter, not threatened or endangered and
are subject to the provisions of this chapter:

1. The arctostaphylos patula species of Manzanita;

2. The cercocarpus ledifolius species of Mountain Mahogany (brush
form) (commonly known in Big Bear Valley as Ironwood);

3. Sage species that occur in the Big Bear Valley.



Page 22
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

a.

© o Ao

The activities would result in significant erosion and sedimentation of surface waters. The
owner of each piece of real property shall, when performing modifications required by this
chapter, keep soil disturbance to a minimum, especially on steep slopes. Erosion control
techniques such as leaving root balls intact, minimizing use of motorized equipment, and
covering exposed disturbed soil areas with mulch or similar materials shall be employed in
order to help reduce soil erosion and plant re-growth.

604.6.2.4 Exceptions.

Nurseries and other similar agricultural and/or horticultural uses shall be exempt from this
chapter, provided the fire chief, or his or her designee, shall have the discretion to enforce
the provisions of this chapter with respect to such businesses as he or she deems necessary
to promote the public health, safety and welfare as it relates to fire safety and/or the health
of the forest. In using his or her discretion, the fire chief, or his or her designee, shall
consider: (i) the health of the brush and/or shrubs involved; (ii) whether the brush and/or
shrubs pose a risk to the public health, safety or welfare of the community; (iii) the type of
brush and/or shrubs involved: (iv) the owner’s maintenance activities involving the brush
and/or shrubs; and (v) any other factors that the fire chief, or his or her designee, deem
relevant when considering the public health, safety and welfare, including, without
limitation, whether such shrub(s) is endangered, rare or threatened.

Up to two inches of dead pine needles, leaves and other soils amendments for soil
replenishment and forest safety may be permitted, when in the opinion of the fire chief, or
his or her designee, they do not constitute a fire hazard. In deciding whether they present a
fire hazard, the fire chief, or his or her designee, shall consider:

The proximity of the pine needles and leaves to buildings or structures;

The height of the lower branches of shrubbery from the ground;

The condition of the shrubbery, (e.g., free from dead and dying limbs and leaves);
The sectioning of the shrubbery; and

Any other factors that the fire chief, or his or her designee, deem relevant when
considering the public health, safety and welfare.

604.6.2.5 Protection of Sensitive Biological Resources.

Should any owner receive a NOTICE TO ABATE form that mandates the modification of
native brush or shrubs other than the following shrub species: Juniper, Spanish Broom or
native brush species: Manzanita, Service Berry, Mountain Whitethorn, Sage, or Mountain
Mahogany and the property falls within the potential sensitive shrub resource area (as set
forth in the Authority’s official records, and which may be amended from time to time), a
sensitive plant survey will be required for the property prior to any abatement activities. If
it is unclear whether a particular property falls within the potential sensitive shrub resource
area or whether or not sensitive plant surveys are required, the owner must contact the
Authority or the City of Big Bear Lake Planning Department. The City’s Planning
Department or Authority shall provide requesting owners with a list of qualified surveyors,
which list may be updated or revised at the discretion of the City or Authority. Ideally,
sensitive plant surveys should be conducted between June and August to encompass the
blooming periods of those sensitive plants that are the most difficult to detect outside the



Page 23
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

blooming period; however, the sensitive plant survey can be conducted during other parts
of the year (aside from periods when snowfall is covering the ground) if necessary. Upon
completion of the survey, the surveyor shall advise the owner as to any known or potential
sensitive plants that should be avoided during abatement activities. A form shall be
completed at the end of the survey that will provide details as to the results of the survey.
The surveyor shall provide a copy of the form to the owner and the Planning or Fire
Departments. The owner shall not conduct any modification without prior written approval
of the City or Authority. All surveys required by this subsection shall be conducted within
a reasonable time as determined by the fire chief, or his or her designee.

If any native brush modification is required for more than twenty (20) shrubs and
vegetation modification activities cannot be performed outside the nesting season (typical
nesting season is March 15 through August 15), a nesting bird survey shall be performed
less than one week prior to vegetation modification activities. Should the owner be required
to conduct a nesting bird survey, he or she shall contact the Authority or the City of Big
Bear Lake Planning Department for a list of qualified nesting bird surveyors, which list
may be updated or revised at the discretion of the Fire Authority or the City. Upon
completion of the survey, the surveyor shall advise the owner as to any shrub(s) containing
nesting birds that should not be modified until the completion of the nesting cycle. A form
shall be completed at the end of the survey that will provide details as to the results of the
survey. The surveyor shall provide a copy of the form to the owner and the Planning and/or
Fire Departments. The owner shall not conduct any modification without prior written
approval of the City or Authority. All surveys required by this subsection shall be
conducted within a reasonable time as determined by the fire chief, or his or her designee.

Any owner receiving a NOTICE TO ABATE form (for any number of shrubs) will also
receive a pamphlet pertaining to providing protection for nesting birds. The pamphlet will
describe the Migratory Bird Treaty Act, and suggest that if vegetation modification will
occur during the nesting season (March 15 through August 15), owners need to check for
the presence of active bird nests and avoid modification of any vegetation containing an
active bird nest (or vegetation within twenty-five (25) feet of the active bird nest) until the
young have fledged.

604.6.2.6 Hazardous Trees. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to any live or

dead tree which constitutes a fire, health or safety hazard or which may endanger or injure
neighboring property, or the health, safety or well-being of persons or property; and it shall be the
duty of every owner, occupant and person in control of any land or interest therein to abate.

b.

604.6.2.7 Outdoor Storage and Uses.

The outdoor storage of any materials or equipment, including but not limited to; lumber,
construction materials, inoperable vehicles, auto parts, household appliances, pipe, drums,
machinery, furniture, or trash is prohibited when, in the opinion of the Fire Code Official,
the materials or conditions would cause an impediment to firefighting or other emergency
efforts.

No open storage shall be permitted in any required front or side yards adjacent to a street
or highway in residential zones.



Page 24
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

&. Amendments to the California Residential Code. The California Residential Code is
amended as follows:

(a) Chapter 3

Section R309.3.1.2 is amended to read:

R309.3.1.2 Required Sprinkler Locations. Sprinklers shall be installed to protect all
areas of a dwelling unit.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Attics, crawl spaces, built-up areas less than five (5) feet in height and normally
unoccupied concealed spaces that do not contain fuel-fired appliances, do not require
sprinklers. In those areas containing fuel-fired appliances, a sprinkler shall be installed
above the appliance.

2. Clothes closets, linen closets, and pantries not exceeding 24 square feet (2.2 m?) in
area, with the smallest dimension not greater than 3 feet (915 mm) and having wall and
ceiling surfaces of gypsum board.

3. Detached garages, carports with no habitable space above, open attached porches,
balconies or stairs, and similar areas.

Section R309.3.5.2 is amended to read:

R309.3.5.2 Required Capacity. The water supply shall have the capacity to provide the
required design flow rate for sprinklers for a minimum of ten (10) minutes regardless of the square
footage or number of stories.

9. Ordinance Repeals

That 2022 Fire Code Ordinance No. BBFA2023-001 and any and all ordinances or parts of
ordinances, including other iterations of Authority Fire Code Ordinances prior to this Ordinance,
in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

10. Severability

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to
be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and
each section, subsection, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

11. Rights Reserved

That nothing in this ordinance or in the Authority Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred,
or any cause or causes of action existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in
Section 8 of this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost,
impaired or affected by this ordinance.



Page 25
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

12. Publication and Certification

The Secretary of the Board of Directors shall certify to the adoption of this ordinance and shall
cause a summary thereof to be published at least five (5) days prior to the meeting at which the
proposed ordinance is to be adopted and shall post a certified copy of the proposed ordinance in
the office of the Secretary of the Board and within fifteen (15) days of its adoption shall cause a
summary of it to be published, including the vote for and against the same, and shall post a certified
copy of the adopted ordinance in the office of the Secretary of the Board, in accordance with
California Government Code Section 36933.

13. CEQA

The Board of Directors finds that it can be seen with certainty that the adoption of this ordinance
will not have a significant effect on the environment and is therefore not subject to the California
Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) of the CEQA Guidelines.

14. Effective Date

This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters established
and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force upon ratification of this ordinance by the
City of Big Bear Lake and the County of San Bernardino along with acceptance by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development pursuant to California Health and Safety
Code Section 13869.7(c).

PASSED, APPROVED, and ADOPTED by the Big Bear Fire Authority Board of Directors at
its regular meeting held the 9th day of December, 2025 by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAINS:

Kendi Segovia
Chair, Board of Directors

Big Bear Fire Authority

ATTEST: REVIEWED AND APPROVED:
Sherry Wentz Nicholaus Norvell

Interim Board Secretary Authority Counsel

Big Bear Fire Authority Best, Best & Krieger, LLP



Page 26
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO )
CITY OF BIG BEAR LAKE )

I, Sherry Wentz, Interim Board Secretary of the Big Bear Fire Authority Board, do hereby certify
that the whole number of members of the said Board is ten; that the foregoing ordinance, being
Ordinance No. BBFA2025-001 was duly passed and adopted by the said Board, approved and
signed by the Chair of said Board, and attested by the Secretary of said Board, all at a meeting of
the said Board held on the 9th day of December, 2025, and that the same was so passed and adopted
by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Witness my hand and the official seal of said Authority this day of ,2025.

Sherry Wentz
Interim Board Secretary
Big Bear Fire Authority



BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
AGENDA REPORT

Item No. FAS
MEETING DATE:  December 9, 2025
TO: Board Chair and Directors of Big Bear Fire Authority
FROM: Luke Wagner, Assistant Fire Chief W
PREPARED BY: Sherry Wentz, Interim Board Secretary
SUBJECT: USE OF FACILITIES AGREEMENT FOR THE PARADISE
TRAINING CENTER
BACKGROUND

At its June 11, 2024, regular Board meeting, Directors were provided a Memorandum of
Understanding (MOU) between Big Bear City Community Services District (CSD) and Big Bear
Fire Authority for review. Within this agreement, there is a section regarding the use of the
Paradise Training Center (PTC). The MOU was not voted on, but rather placed on hold while
the Big Bear Lake Fire Protection District Board continued its review on the Big Bear Fire
Authority Joint Powers Agreement.

At its May 13, 2025, regular Board meeting, Directors authorized the Board Chair to sign the 6-
month temporary use of facility agreement; requested staff update the verbiage to be more
specific to the Authority’s responsibility only while on the property; and for the Authority to also
look into agreements regarding the use of other Authority facilities.

DISCUSSION

The proposed agreement allows the Authority to continue using the Paradise Yard for a period of
twelve (12) months under the terms described in the agreement. Consistent with the Board’s
prior direction, the agreement provides that the Authority is responsible for security and
supervision only during scheduled Authority events.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends the Fire Authority Board authorize the Board Chair to sign the proposed 12-
month Use of Facility Agreement to continue use of the Paradise Training Center on CSD

property.

Attachment: Proposed Facilities Use Agreement



PQNO BIG BEAR CITY e
U

LY Community Services District

USE OF FACILITY AGREEMENT

This Use of Facility Agreement ("Agreement") is entered into this 9th day of December, 2025, by and
between the Big Bear City Community Services District ("CSD") and the Big Bear Fire Authority ("User"),
each a member of the California JPIA, and collectively referred to as the "Parties."

1. PURPOSE AND SCOPE

This Agreement permits the Big Bear Fire Authority (BBFA) to use a designated area within the CSD
Paradise Maintenance Yard (the “Facility”) for the purpose of conducting BBFA training classes,
education sessions, and other activities that include expert personnel from outside agencies to receive
or deliver educational material. (the “Permitted Uses”).

The general public shall not be permitted to enter the Facility. Examples may include, but are not limited
to, Board meetings that include either open or closed sessions, committees of the BBFA Board, and
public informational sessions.

The purpose of these limitations is to minimize exposure to trip and fall accidents, prevent access to
unsecured areas, reduce the risk of property damage or theft, and limit potential emergency or safety
issues that could arise without staff oversight.

The BBFA shall provide the CSD with a monthly Calendar of intended use with 7 days’ notice prior to the
beginning of each month. Additions can only be added with the GM’s approval once the month has
started.

2. LOCATION

The portions of the Facility covered by the agreement are the CSD Fire Department training classroom,
surrounding training structures, adjacent parking lot, and the main access road to the area set aside for
Fire Department activities located at the Northeast corner of 417 E Grenfall Ln, Big Bear City, CA 92314.
Access is limited strictly to these areas. All other parts of the Facility may not be used under this
Agreement.

3. TERM

This Agreement is effective for 12 months from the date specified above unless extended, cancelled,
amended, or superseded in writing by mutual agreement of the Parties. This Agreement can be
terminated by either party upon 3 days' written notice to the main offices of the other party.

/\/>*/\/\

Office 909.585.2565 | After Hours Emergency 909.585.2567 | Fax 909.585.0025 | 139 E. Big Bear Blvd. | PO Box 558 | Big Bear City, CA 92314 | bbccsd.org




PQN BIG BEAR CITY

WY Community Services District

4. LIABILITY AND INSURANCE

A. Self-Insured Coverage: The Parties acknowledge they are members of the California JPIA, a self-
insured risk-sharing pool. Notwithstanding this, the User shall provide a Certificate of Coverage
prior to the event, evidencing:

- General Liability coverage applicable to the proposed use.
- Naming BBCCSD as an Additional Insured Party.
- Coverage limits are no less than $1,000,000 per occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate.

B. Indemnification: The Big Bear Fire Authority agrees to indemnify, defend, and hold harmless CSD
and its officers, officials, employees, and agents from and against any and all claims, damages,
losses, and expenses arising out of or related to the public use of the Facility, except to the extent
caused by the sole negligence or willful misconduct of CSD.

5. SECURITY AND SUPERVISION

The Fire Department is responsible for the following only during scheduled events:

- Providing on-site personnel to monitor that there is no public entry to the facility while the gate is
open, either through the use of the keypad or Knox lock activation.

- Preventing unauthorized access to other areas of the CSD Yard.

- Access codes are used to open the automated gate.

- The Knox lock access is engaged for 30 minutes when any outside agencies are scheduled to arrive or
during scheduled breaks in the training schedule, for ingress and egress to occur.

- The automatic gate function is reengaged after the 30-minute allowable Knox lock use.

- Greater diligence on security outside of regular CSD operational hours.

- Ensuring the site is locked and secured upon conclusion of the event.

No public access is permitted.

6. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

The User shall comply with all applicable local, state, and federal laws, ordinances, regulations, and
Facility rules, including any fire code, public health, and ADA requirements.

/\/>*/\/\

Office 909.585.2565 | After Hours Emergency 909.585.2567 | Fax 909.585.0025 | 139 E. Big Bear Blvd. | PO Box 558 | Big Bear City, CA 92314 | bbccsd.org




PQN BIG BEAR CITY

WY Community Services District

7. NO LEASE OR TENANCY

This Agreement does not constitute a lease or conveyance of any interest in real property. It is a
temporary license to use the designated area for the limited purpose stated herein.

8. MODIFICATION

This Agreement may only be modified in writing and signed by authorized representatives of both
Parties.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties have executed this Agreement on the date first written above.

Big Bear City Community Services District Big Bear Fire Authority

By: By:

Name: John Russo Name: Kendi Segovia

Title: Board President Title: Board Chair

Date: Date: December 9, 2025
Pat—n

Office 909.585.2565 | After Hours Emergency 909.585.2567 | Fax 909.585.0025 | 139 E. Big Bear Blvd. | PO Box 558 | Big Bear City, CA 92314 | bbccsd.org



BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
AGENDA REPORT

Item No. FA6
MEETING DATE:  December 9, 2025
TO: Board Chair and Directors of the Big Bear Fire Authority
FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief W
PREPARED BY: Kristin Mandolini, Director of Business Services 44(4\
SUBJECT: AMENDMENT TO FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026 BIG BEAR FIRE

AUTHORITY BUDGET, Director Russo Initiated Item

This agenda report was prepared by staff at the request of the Board Chair.

BACKGROUND

Each year staff prepares a draft budget for review by the Board of Directors providing the
opportunity for Board input and questions regarding fiscal plans and financial projections. On
May 13, 2025, May 21, 2025, and June 10, 2025, the Board considered the draft preliminary
budget for the 2025-2026 fiscal year. Finance Committee meetings were also held on July 10,
2025, and August 25, 2025, to discuss the proposed budget.

As a result of the budget workshop discussion on May 13, 2025, the Board approved noticing of
the Fiscal Year 2025-2026 Budget to be considered for adoption at the June 10, 2025, board
meeting. This was published in the Big Bear Grizzly Newspaper on May 22, 2025.

At the September 9, 2025, regular board meeting, the Board approved the proposed budget with
the removal of Fire Station 282 roof project, removal of HRA account for the Ambulance
Operators, and removal of the CSD streetlights line item from the expense category to a
deduction in tax revenue.

DISCUSSION

The Fire Authority’s approved Fiscal Year 2025-2026 budget includes revenues of $21,147,247
and expenses of $19,902,955 for a positive bottom line of $1,244,292. The budget identifies a
total of $14,277,668 in expenditures that exclude the independent operations of air operations
and mutual aid. In summary, this includes operations expenses of $13,239,868, ambulance
service projected loss of $492,872, prevention projected loss of $7,196, and debt service
expenses of $537,732.




Agenda Report — FY2025-2026 Budget Amendment
December 9, 2025
Page 2

On November 12, 2025, the Fire Protection District (FPD) held a regular board meeting and
approved a 2025-2026 FPD operating budget of $8,763,800 in revenue restricted for fire
services, and $179,700 in expenditures. FPD has indicated that it anticipates contributing
$6,959,134 as its share of expenses towards the Fire Authority’s annual budget, which amount
represents 50% of the Fire Authority’s budgeted expenses (excluding air operations and mutual
aid) minus $179,700 in expenditures that FPD staff believes it is entitled to as a credit
(514,277,688 x 50% = $7,138,834 - §179,700 = $6,959,134). FPD has indicated that $1,624,970
will remain in the FPD’s restricted fund balance for future fire related services and capital
expenditures.

Following the FPD’s board meeting on November 12, 2025, Big Bear City Community Services
District’s (CSD) Board President, John Russo, responded with a letter to Board Chair Segovia
discussing the CSD’s perspective on the impacts of the FPD’s budget approval. The letter
requests the Fire Authority Board consider amending the Fire Authority’s budget in order to
reflect equal and lower contributions from both parties. Director Russo’s letter is included as an
attachment.

On November 21, 2025, the Fire Authority delivered to FPD and CSD identical invoices for
payment in the amount of $3,569,418 each, for contributions towards the Fire Authority’s
budgeted expenses, which amount represents expenses, as outlined in paragraph one of the
discussion paragraph for the first six months of the 2025-2026 Fiscal Year. Neither invoice
reflects any credit amount for either FPD or CSD, and Fire Authority staff has stated that it will
defer to the direction of its Board of Directors with respect to whether or not any proposed
credits should be issued.

Historically, the Fire Authority was funded by property tax revenues from both FPD and CSD.
For Fiscal Year 2025-2026, the Fire Authority anticipates CSD will have $6,249,390 in property
tax revenue available for contribution to the Fire Authority. Thus, absent a budget amendment,
significant operational reductions, or an alternative solution, Fire Authority staff projects that a
budget deficit in the amount of roughly $889,444, equivalent to the difference between 50% of
calculated shared costs and available CSD tax revenue ($7,138,834 - $6,249,390) will occur,
excluding air operations and mutual aid, during Quarter 4 of the 2025-2026 Fiscal Year.

FISCAL IMPACT
To be determined by the Board of Directors.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends the Board discuss and provide direction to staff.

4914-8294-8990



PQN BIG BEARCITY  rcuen

LY Community Services District

Via Electronic Mail

Kendie Segovia, Chair

Big Bear Lake Fire Authority
41090 Big Bear Boulevard
Big Bear Lake, CA 92315

Re: Motion to Amend Budget
Dear Ms. Segovia,

As you know, the Big Bear Fire Authority approved a budget for the Authority on September 9, 2025, which
estimated the expenses of the Fire Authority in excess of revenues at $14,761.416. The motion to adopt the
budget passed by an 8-2 vote, following a long discussion in which it was made abundantly clear that the Big Bear
City Community Services District could not promise to spend money that it did not have and could not muster.

For months, representatives for BBCCSD repeatedly stated that the budget should be adopted to reflect an equal
contribution toward expenses and that the budget should not be adopted at a number that was more than the
BBCCSD could contribute, with the City of Big Bear Lake Fire Protection District meeting the BBCCSD’s
contribution. Indeed, BBCCSD’s continuing reservations about adopting a budget more than it could contribute
led to the debate over adoption of the budget so late in the fiscal year!

Nonetheless, to provide the Fire Authority with certainty about its continuing financial operations, and in a good
faith attempt to maintain the status quo pending the outcome of the studies that the BBCCSD agreed in good
faith to join, board members from the BBCCSD voted to approve the budget on September 9" including expenses
that are in excess of BBCCSD'’s ability to pay.

Now it appears that the FPD is determined to reduce its contribution to the Fire Authority through this latest FPD
budget, and also “reserving” its rights to presumably come after the BBCCSD for what it believes it is owed for
paying more than its fair share.

With all of this in mind, the BBCCSD board members sitting on the Fire Authority will be making a motion to
reconsider the budget approval vote to amend the current budget to reflect the equal and lower contributions of
the parties. If necessary, all members of the BBCCSD will vote against any expenditures in excess of the amount
that BBCCSD is able to contribute.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Jo usso
B&ard President

ss BIG BEAR CITY

Community Services Bistrict

o~ N

Office 909.585.2565 | After Hours Emergency 909.585.2567 | Fax 909.585.0025 | 139 E. Big Bear Blvd. | PO Box 558 | Big Bear City, CA 92314 | bbccsd.org



ATTACHMENT


BIG BEAR FIRE AUTHORITY
AGENDA REPORT

Item No. FA7
MEETING DATE:  December 9, 2025
TO: Board Chair and Members of Big Bear Fire Authority
FROM: Luke Wagner, Fire Chief %}
PREPARED BY: Sherry Wentz, Interim Board Secretary
SUBJECT: BOARD REORGANIZATION - SELECTION OF THE 2026

BOARD CHAIR AND VICE CHAIR

BACKGROUND

The Bylaws and Policies of the Big Bear Fire Authority (Bylaws) establish the rules and process
for selecting a Board Chair and Vice Chair of its Board. At its regular meeting in the last quarter
of each calendar year, or as soon thereafter as reasonably possible, the Board shall select from
amongst its members its Board Chair and Vice Chair for the following year by the following
process:

1. The Board Chair shall open the nominations for the subsequent Board Chair.

2. The Board Chair shall then close nominations, and the Board shall vote to elect the new
Board Chair.

3. Immediately upon election, the newly elected Board Chair shall assume all duties and
responsibilities of the Board Chair.

4. The newly elected Board Chair shall then open the nominations for the Vice Chair.

5. The Board Chair shall close the nominations, and the Board shall vote to elect the new Vice
Chair.

6. Immediately upon election, the newly elected Vice Chair shall assume all duties and
responsibilities of the Vice Chair.

The Board Chair shall alternate between the member agencies each year, such that the Board
Chair selected for the following year shall not be from the same member agency that provided
that Board Chair for the current year. The Vice Chair shall rotate each year in the same manner
as the Board Chair.

DISCUSSION

The Board Chair for the 2025 calendar year has been Kendi Segovia, a Director the Big Bear
Lake Fire Protection District; therefore, a new Board Chair from Big Bear City Community
Services District must be nominated and elected to fill the position of Board Chair for 2026. The




Agenda Report December 9, 2025
Selection of Board Chair and Vice Chair
Page 2

Vice Chair for the 2025 calendar year has been Bob Rowe, a Director from the Big Bear City
Community Services District. Therefore, a new Vice Chair from the Big Bear Lake Fire
Protection District must be nominated and elected to fill the position for 2026.

RECOMMENDATIONS

1. The Board Chair shall open nominations for a new Board Chair from Big Bear City
Community Services District, to be approved by vote of the Board.

2. The newly elected Board Chair shall immediately take over the proceedings of the Board and
open nominations for a Vice Chair from the Big Bear Lake Fire Protection District, to be
approved by a vote of the Board.



